
(
BILL NO. 2019-13

NYE COUNTY ORDINANCE NO. 546

SUMMARY: An ordinance to repeal and replace in its entirety Nyc County Code
Chapter 15.17.010. the Building and Construction Codes Effective
within Nyc Count, and amend Nyc County Code Chapter 15.16 the
Building and Construction Codes Effective within the Pahrump
Regional Planning District, by rcpealing the prcviously adopted
building and construction codes, listed appendices. and related
amendments thereto and sections therein, and adopting new
international and uniform building and construction codes, listed
appendices, and amendments thereto, to he applicable and effective
within all of Nyc County. as specifically noted herein; and providing
fiji the severability, constitutionality and effective (late thereof; and
other matters properly relating thereto.

TITLE. AN ORDINANCE TO REPEAL NYE COUNTY CODE CHAPTER 15.17. THE BUILDING AND
CONSTRUCTION CODES EFFECTIVE WITHIN NYE COUNTY .AND AMEND NYE
COUNTY CODE CHAPTER 15.16, UNIFORM CONSTRUCTION CODES EFFECTIVE
WITHIN THE PAHRUMP REGIONAL PLANNING DISTRICT, BY DELETING THE
EXISTING INTERNATIONAL AND UNIFORM BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES
NOTED THEREIN. AND REPLACING THEM WITH THE FOLLOWING INTERNATIONAL
AND UNIFORM BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES TO BE APPLICABLE AND
EFFECTIVE WITHIN ALL OF NYE COUNTY: THE 2018 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL (‘ODE
COUNCIL. INCLUDING APPENDICES C. E. 6. 1 AND J; THE 2018 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL
CODE COUNCIL. INCLUDING APPENDIX K: ‘[HE 2018 EDITION OF THE
INIERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY TIlE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; THE 201$ EDITION OF THE UNIFORM MECHANICAL
CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL ASSOCIATION OF PLUMBING &
MECHANICAL OFFICIALS. INCLUDING APPENDICES H; THE 2018 EDITION OF THE
UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL ASSOCIATION
OF PLUMBING & MECHANICAL OFFICIALS; THE 2017 EDITION OF THE NATIONAL
ELECTRIC CODE, AS PUBLISHED BY THE NATIONAL FIRE PREVENTION
ASSOCIATION: THE 201$ INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL & SPA CODE AS
PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL THE 2018 EDITION OF THE
INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE, AS PUBI.ISHED BY THE
INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL; THE 201$ EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL FIRE
CODE. AS PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNA1’IONAL CODE COUNCIL, INCLUDING
NEVADA STATE FIRE MARSHAL ADOPTED AMENDMENTS, AND ALL AMENDMENTS
TO INTERNATIONAL AND UNIFORM BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES AS
NOTED IN EXHIBIT I. AND ALL OTHER MATTERS AS PROPERLY RELATED THERETO.

Pigc 1 of 58



C C
WHEREAS, pursuant to NRS 244.119, the Nyc County Board of Commissioners (‘Board”) is

authorized to amend Nyc County Code: and

WHEREAS. pursuant to NRS 244.3675(l), the Board may regulate all matters relating to the
construction, maintenance and safety’ of buildings, structures and property within the County; and

WHEREAS. pursuant NRS 244.3675(2). the Board may adopt any building, electrical. piLimbing. or
safety’ code necessary to regulate building safety in Nyc County: and

WHEREAS. pursuant to NRS 244.105. the Board may adopt uniform codes by reference ith such
changes as may be necessary to make it applicable to conditions in the county. and with such other
changes as may he desirable.

NOW. THEREFORE. pursuant to NRS 244.110. the Board of County Commissioners of the Counly
of Nyc. State of Nevada. does ordain:

NYE COUNTY CODE TITLE 15 AMENDED. Ne County Code Chapter 15.16 is amended to read
as follows:

Section 15.16: International and Uniform Building and Construction Codes Effective Within
Nye Count

Section 15.16.010: Codes Adopted

Existing section /5. 16.011) is /,c’,’ebr deleted in i/s en/heir and replaced it’ll/i new section 15.16.010 as
/olloti’s:

Section 15.16.010: International anti Uiiifonn Building and Construction Codes Atlo1jted:

The 201 8 Edition ol the International Building Code, as published by the International Code CouncH
including appendices C, F, G, 1. and J ; The 201 $ Edition of the International Residential Code, as
published by the International (‘ode Council, including Appendix K; The 2015 Edition of the
International Energy Conservation (‘ode. as published by the International Code Council: The 20 I 8
Edition of the Uniform Mechanical Code, as publislieLl by thc International Association of P1 umb ing &
Mechanical Officials: The 2018 Edition of the Uniform Plumbing Code, as published by the
International Association of Plumbing & Mechanical Officials: The 2017 Edition of the National
Eleciric Code. as published by the National Fire Prevention Association: The 2018 Edition of the
International Property Ni aintenance Code, as published by the International Code Council The 2018
Edition of the International Fire Code, as published by the International Code Council, including
Nevada State Eire Marshal adopted amendments, and all amendments to International and Unifbnu
Building and Construction Codes as noted in Exhibit I; are hereby adopted by the Nyc County Board
of C’ounty Commissioners (‘Board’’) for the purpose of prescribing regulations for the erection,
construction, modification, use and occupancy of newly constructed habitable residential, commercial.
and industrial buildings and previously permitted habitable residential, commercial, and industrial
building, and all buildings commencing or completed within Nyc County’. One copy of each of the
above identified publications are on file in the Pahrump Office of the Nyc County Clerk for public
inspection and are adopted with the same full force and effect as though set out herein.

Pe 2 u: 58



(
Section 15.16.015: Amendments to Codes: Adopt all amendments to International and Uniform
Building and Construction Codes as noted in Exhibit I.

Section 15.16.020: Liability:

This section rcinan:s tinchangeci and is incorporated herein.

Section 15.16.030: Definitions:

This section icnunns unchanged and is incorporated he/en?.

Section 15.16.040: Alternate Materials. Alternate Design and Methods of Construction:

T/i is section remains (IC/I anged a;id is incorporated herein.

Section 15.16.050: Permits Required:

Except/or ftc fo//on tng changes. this Section remains iuitcitcinged and is incorporated hercin:

C. In accordance with Section 103.1.1 of the 2018 Uniform Plumbing Code, Section 112.1 of the
24118 U&form Mechanical Code, anti Section 105.1 of the 2018 International Building Code
permits are hereby required.

D. Permits are required in accordance with Section 105.2(2) of the 2018 International Building
Code for walls and fences over six (6) feet in height.

F. Areas located outside of the Pahnimp Regional Planning District (“PRPD”) shall be e-cmpt
from the requirement to obtain permits required 1w this section, except as dcscnhcd in
15.16.050.F. However, ally person who desires to construct any residential or commercial
occupancy building outside of the PRPD which is exempt from obtaining a building permit
nui. voluntarily, request and obtain a building permit.

F. For areas located outside of the Pahrunip Regional Planning District, an owner or authorized
agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, repair, or change the occupancy or use of a
building or structure or to cause an’ such work to occur, as related to any use of land or
Lmilding which requires a Special Use Permit, shall make application to the building and safety
department and obtain the required building permits.

Section 15.16.065: Minimum Distances to Ground Faulting or Fissuring, and Other Subsidence
Features:

Tins section renia is unchanged and is incorporated herein.

Section 15.16.070: Grading Designation:

This section remains unchanged and is incorporated herein.

Section 15.16.075: Geotechnical Report:

Prize 3 o153



(
This seetioii ieniaiiis uiichaiigc’d au,! is iiicoijorated heieui.

Section 15.16.076: Swell Test:

Tb/s section iGnulins unchanged and is uicoipoiatcci heicin.

Section 15.16.077:Flooding or Jetting for Backfill Compaction, and Maximum Design Total andDifferential Settlements:

1/i/s section remains unchanged and is incorporated herein.

Section 15.16.078: Post Tensioned Slabs:

i/i/s section ieiiiaii:s iiichangcd and is nicorpoiated herein.

Section 15.16.090: M inimnin Standards for Plumbing Fixtures:

lids secUon ieniains unchanged and is nicoipoid ted here/u,.

Section 15.16.091: Individual Sewage Disposal Systems:

fYi/s section i eznai :s inichanged and is nicorjuoated heir/n.

Section 15.1 6.092:i1iiiinium Standards for Manufactured I tunics:

fins section remains unchanged and is nicoipaiated heicin.

Section 15.1 6.094:Requircnients for Residential Swinrniing Pools, Hot Ttilj. anti Spas:

17,/s see/ion remains iniehanged and is nieo;poid ted heir/i,.

Section 15.16. 100:Uniform Mechanical Code: — Title 24 Reference Deleted

lit/s see/ion remains unchanged and is tncorporatcd herein.

Section 15.16.110: Penalties:

This section remains unchanged ((lid is incorporated heieni.

Section 15.16.130: Repeal:

This section icinains unchanged and is / icoipoiated herein.

Section 15.16.140: Severability:

This see//Oil ieniai is nizehanged and is / icorporated here/i.

Page 4 of 58



( C’
Section 15.16.150: Constitutionality:

Tins sec/jo/i icuzains unchanged and is nicoiporared heicbr

Section 15.16,16(1: Effective Date:

Existing seetioji 15.16.160 is hereby amended (Is follows:

Br dc/cling the phrase: “from and after the 5th (lay of April. 2007”, and Br icp/acnlg it with:” from
and after the 1S1 day of January, 2020

SEVERABILITY. If any provision of this ordinance or amendments thcreto. or the application to any
person. thing or circumstance is held to be invalid, such invalidity shall not affect the validity or
provisions or applications of the ordniancc or amendments thereto which can be given effect without
the invalid provisions or applications, and to this end the provisions of this ordinance and amendments
thereto are declared to be severable.

CONSTITUTIONALITY. If aim’ section, clause or phrase of tlus oidinance shall he declared
unconstitutional by a court ot competent jurisdiction, the remaining provisions ol this ordinance shall
continue in full ftircc and effect.

Effective Date. Tius Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and alter passage approval, and
publication as required by law, to wit. from and after the day of January. 2020.

Proposed on the 2O day of August, 2019.

Proposed b\ Corn miss loner SI undo

Adopted on the 4” (lay of August, 2019

Vote: Ayes: Commissioners: Koenig. Strickland. \Vichman. BILindo. (‘ox

Nays: Commissioners: 0

Absent: Commissioners: C)

BY:

____ _____ ____________

ATTEST: (
JoIKoenig ‘ ainuan Sndra L. Merlino
Nyc County oard of Clerk and Ex-Officio
County Commissioners Clerk of the Board

Ptwc 5 of 58



c C
2018 NTh COUNTY AMENDMENTS

2018 fNTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE

2018 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL (‘ODE

2018 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE

2018 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE

2018 UNIFORM MECHANICAL CODE

2018 UNIFORM PLUMBING CODE

2017 NATIONAL ELECTR ICAL CODE

201$ INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

201$ INTERNATIONAL SWIMMING POOL & SPA CODE

201$ INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE

PREFA(’E

This document comprises the Nyc County Amenclments to the following codes:

201 8 International B uilding Code as published liv the international Code Council.

201$ International Residential Code as published by the International Code Council.

2015 International Energy Conservation Code

201$ Uniform Mechanical Code as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
Officials.

201$ Uniform Plumbing Code as published by the International Association of Plumbing and Mechanical
O fIi ci aI s.

2017 National Electrical (‘ode as published by the National Fire Protection Association.

201$ International Property Maintenance Code

2018 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code

Page 6 of 58



( (
2018 International Fire Code as published by the International Code Council

TABLE OF CONTENTS

2018 International Building Code

Section 202 Definitions
Section 305.2.3 Six or Fewer Children in a Dwelling Unit
Section 308.3 Institutional Group 1—1
Section 308.3.3 Board of I-Iealth Group 1-2
Section 308.5 Institutional 1-4
Section 308.5.1 Classification of Group E
Section 308.5.3 Six or Fewer Persons Receiving Care
Section 30. 5.4 Six or Fewer Persons Receiving Care in a Dwelling Unit
Section 310.2 Residential Group R-1
Section 310.3 Residential Group R-2
Section 310.4 Residential Group R-3
Section 310.4.1 Care Facilities Within a Dwelling
Section 403.5.4 Smokeproof Enclosures
Section 406.3.3 C’arports
Section 903.3.1.2 NEPA I 3R Sprinkler Systems
Section 903.3.2 Approved Automatic Sprinkler Systems
Section 1109.16 Baby Changing Tables
Section 3102.7 Engineering Design

2018 International Residential Code

Section RI 01.! Title
Section RIO 1.2 Scope
Table R301.2(1)
Table R301.5
Section R301.6 Roof Loads
Section R302. I Exterior Walls
Section R307. I Space Required
Section R3 13.1 Townhouse Automatic Fire Sprinkler System
Section R3 13.2 One and Two Family dwellings Automatic Fire Systems
Section R3 15.2.2 Alterations, repairs, and additions
Section R40 1.3 Drainage
Section R401.4 Soils Test
Section R401.5 Grading Plan
Section R406.2 Concrete, and Masonry foundation Waterproofing
Section R506.2.3 Vapor Retarder
Section R807. 1 Attic Access
Section R905.7 Wood Shingles
Section R905.8 Wood Shakes
Section 1007 Types of Fireplaces

Page 7 ni 58



(r

Section 1008 Special Fiieplaces and Appliances Requirements
Deleted Chapters
Table R806.5 Climate Zone Insulation R Value
P29042.3 Freezing Areas
Appendix H — Patio Covers
Appendix K — Sound Transmission

2018 International Energy Conservation Code

Section C202 Definitions
Section C30101 General
Section C402.5.9 Air Curlains
Section C405.3. I Total Connected Interior Lighting Power
Section C405.4. I Total connected exterior building lighting power
Section (408.3.1 Fnnctional Testing
Section C503.6 Lighting Power
Section R402.4. 12 Testing
Seclion R301 .1 General
Section R403 .6 Mechanical Ventilation

2018 Uniform Mechanical Code

Section 304.3.12 Pennanent Ladders
Section 304.4 Appliances in Attics and Under—Floor spaces
Section 504.4 Total Connected Interior Lighting Power
Section 504.4.2.1 Length Limitation
Section 505.3 Makeup Air
Section 5 1 0. 1 6. 1 Bracing and Supports
Section 511.2.2.1.1 Performance Test
Section 603.4.1 Length Limitations
Section 603.13 Air Dispersion Systems
Section 608.1 Automatic Shutoffs
Section 802 .6. 1 Term mat ion Requirements
Section Chapter 10 Boilers and Pressure Vessels
Section 1301.2 Dry Gas
Section 131 0. 16 Piping Undcrground Beneath Buildings

2018 Uniform Plumbing Code

Section 3 10.4 Use of Vent and Waste Pipes
Section 411.2 Water Consumption
Section 412.1 Water Consumption
Section 418.3 Location of Floor Drains
Section 422.0 Minimum number of Required Fixtures
Section 507.1 Installation in Residential Garages
Section 508.3.2 Access Type
Section 500.6.1 Termination Requirements

Pagc 8 ot 58



C
Section 603.5.12 Beverage Dispensers
Section 603.4 .2 Testing
Section 608.5 Discharge Piping
Section 704.3 Commercial Sinks
Section 707 Fittings
Section 710.1 Backf]ow Protection
Section 723.1 General (Building Sewer Test)
Section 801.3.2 Walk-in Coolers
Section 801 .3.4 Floor Sinks
Section 804.1 Standpipe Receptors
Section 1009.0 Gravity Grease Interceptors
Section 1010.0 SandOil Interceptors
Section 101 1.0 Maintenance of Interceptors
Section 1101.2 Where Required
Section 1101.6 Subsoil Drains
Section 1101.11 Filling Stations and Motor Vehicle Washing Establishments
Section 1101 . 11 Paved Areas
Section 1109.2 Methods of Jesting Storm Drainage Systems
Section 12 10. 1 6 Piping Underground and Beneath Buildings

2017 National Electrical Code

Section 2l0.70(A)(l) Habitable Rooms
Section 210.70(A)(2) Additional Locations
230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location
Article 225.32 Location
Section 230.70(A)( I) Readily Accessible Location
Section 250.52(A)(5) Rod Electrodes
Section 250.53 Grounding Electrode Syslcm Installation

2018 International Property Maintenance (:0(10

(INSERT SECTION AM ENDiMENTS)

2018 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code

Section Chapter 1
Section C’hapter 2 Detinitions
Section 304
Section 305 Barriers
Section 305.1 General
Section 305.2.2 Wrought Iron
Section 305.2.2.1 Wrought Iron with Masonry
Section 305.2.3 Solid Banicr Surface
Section 305.2.4 Chain Link Dimensions
Section 305.2.5 Diagonal Members

Pc 9 of 53



C
Section 305.3 Gates
Section 305.3.1 Gates or Doors
Section 305.3 .2 Latches
Section 305.4 Large Access BatTier Gates
Section 305,5 Double or Multiple Gates
Section 305.6 Electric Operated Gates
Section 305.7. Secondary Access Barrier Requirement
Section 305.9 Natural Barriers
Section 305.10 Natural Topography
Section 307.1.1 Glazing In Hazardous Locations
Section 307.2.2 Materials and Structural Design
Section 311.2.4 Adequate Drainage
Section 13 1 .4 Location
Section 320.1 Backwash Water or Draining Water
Section 323.1 Handholds
Section 323.4 Wind Sensors
Section 323.5 Water Features
Section 324 Site \Vork. Setbacks and Clearances

2012 International Fire Code

No Amendments

2018 International Building Code

Section 202 Definitions

Ai;iciicl Suction 2(12 lo read cr/ollo1rs:

BA BY UN ANG IN GT ABLE. A tabic or other device that is safe and sanitar\ 11w changing the diaper of
a child agc 3 or tinder.

BIJILDING PA I). Ihe soil, cut or till site. outlined by the area of the footprint of the building plus a
miiuinuni of 5 additional feet (1529 mm) to the exterior. Ibis includes an> type otloundation system flw the
St itict Lire.

CERTI El’. Use of the word certify’ or ‘‘eerti lication’ constitutes an expression of professional opinion
regarding those facts or findings which are the subject of the certification.

ELECTRIC VEHICLE CHARGING STATION. One or more dedicated parking spaces that arc provided
to accommodate charging o [electric motor vehicles

El NAL GRADING RE PORT A urading report stamped and si czned by a ,ceist&’;cd clcsin
jn’oI&’ssiona/ certifying that the building pad was constrLteted in eontbrmanee with the reeomniendations set
tbrth in the geotechni cal report. This report coal a ins explicit information and data that \eri es coinpi i ance
with the geoteehnical report of record including any appro’ cd supplements or addendums.

Fl RE CODE OFFIC IA I.. The fire chief or other designated authori Iv charged with the administration and

Pagc tO of 58



( (
en fbrcciuent ot the I,iu,n000;ial lire Cock, or a duly nut honzed representative.

HIGH-RISE BUILDING. A building with an occupied floor located more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above
the lowest level of fire department vehicle access.

PAD CERTIFICATION REPORT. An interim srading rcpotl stamped and >igned by a rcgLstcird design
pi’ulessional certi fyi ng that the building pad currently is in coniormance with the recommendations set forth
in the geotechnical report of record.

SI-IA DE STRIJ (‘TURE. A structure \\ ith not ss than 50 percent ot its pen neler xsal I area unenclosed, has
no interior partitions. and provides solar or weather protection for uses accessory to a hui cling of any
Occlil)anc\ hoc/c’ sfl’iiettues shall not apply to ecihana.s. canopies. roof structures over vehicle dri\ c through
lanes (porte—coeheres). parking thei Ii ties. playgroLind structures, or industrial uses.

Section 305.2.3

.-lmc’,m Sect/ñi 305.2.3 to icaci as

305.2.3 Six or fewer children iii a dwelling Linit. A facility such as the above within a dwelling unit and
having six or fewer children receiving such clay care shall be classified as a Group R—3 occupancy or shall
comply with the international Residential (‘ode.

Section 308.3 Institutional, Gronp I—I

Ac/cl new subsection to 303:

308.3 Institutional Group I—I. This occupancy shall include buildings, structures or poos thereof for
more than 16 persons who reside on a 24—hour basis in a supervised environment and receive custodial care.
The Persons receiving care are capable of self—preservation. This group shall include, but not be limited to,
the followi itg:

Alcohol and drug centers

Assisted living facilities

Congregate care facilities

Convalescent facilities

Group homes

Halfway houses

Residential hoard and custodial care facilities

Social rehabilitation facilities

308.3.1 Five or fewer persons receiving care. A facility such as the above with five or fewer persons receiving
such care shall he classified as Group R—3 or shall comply with the Intel? ational Residential (‘ode provided
an automatic sp;’uikler system is installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.3 or with Section P2904 of the
International Residential Code.

Page II of’ 58



( (
308.3.2 Six to sixteen persons receiving care. A facility such as above, housing not fewer than six and not
more than 16 persons receiving such care, shall be classified as Group R-4.

308.3.3 Board of Health. All portions of a care facility which houses patients or residents which is classified
by the State Board of Health as ‘Category 2.’ and which has an occupant load of more than 10 residents, is
classified as an I-l occupancy classification.

Section 308.5

.-lniene/ .5cc/ion 31)5.3 to i’eol asfo1/o:is;

308.5 Institutional Group 1—4, day carc fitcilities. IlistitLitional Group 1 —4 o upancy shall include
hui Idings and structures occupied In more than six persons of any age \vllO receive clLcto(/iai care for fewer
than 24 hours per day by persons other thai parents or guardianN. relativcs H. blood inamage or adoption.
and in a place other than the home of the prsun cared fbi. This group shall include. but 1101 be limited to. the
fllowing:

i-\dult ay care

Child day care

308.5.1 Ci assilication as Group E. A child day care fbci ity that provides care fbr more than six but no
more than 100 children 2 years or less of age. where the rooms iii which the children arc cared far arc
located on a in ‘ci @1 evil disehai’,’e serving sucl i looms and each of these ch d care rooms has an vi/
door directly to the exterior shall he classified as Group E.

308.5.3 Six or fewer persons rccei \ ing care. A facility having six or lever persons receiving eitsio/iai
(ale shall he classified as part of the priniary occupancy.

308.5.4 Six or fewer persons receiving care ‘ui a dw elliiig unit. A tileilit\ such as ihe above wiihni a
(Are/i/Jig mat and having six or fewer persons reccivinu em/cloLh(t! CLue shall he classilied as a ( iroup
R-3 occi.ipanev or shall comply with the ha ei’utcttfonu/ l?e.kL’t it/ui (‘ode.

Section 310.2 Residential Group R-1

Amend 31(1.3 to i’ead as/h/lois:

310.2 Residential Group R—1. Residential occupancies containing sleeping units where the occupants are
primarily transient in nature, including:

Boarding houses (transient) with more than I 0 occupants

Brothels

Congregate thing/he/i/ties (transient) with more than 10 occupants

Hotels (transient)

Motels (transient)

Piigc 12 of 58



( (
Section 310.3

I n:c’nd Section 3 / Ui to tend as b/b iis:

3J 0.3 Residential Group R—2. Residential Group R—2 oceupanc es eontaiflinr! sbeepiiig i/hit.’ or iii ore
ihan two aweiling 11/711% \\ fore tile occupants are primarily perimlnent in nature. including:

Apartment houses Condom iniutils ( nontransient

C o;.g;cgafc hr/hg /acihiiics ( nontnns ent ) tvi th more than 1 6 OceLIpants

Boardi fig houses ( nontransi ent)

Convents

Doniiitorics

Iraternities and sororities

r\lonasterics

I bids ( nontransient

Live: work units

Motels (no nt rans i eat)

Vacation timeshare proper! es

Section 310.4

.inuid S tititi 3/1)4 to 11(1(1 ftc

3 10.4 Resident ml C VOLI p It—3 . Residential C roup R—3 oce upanc les where the occupants are primari lv
permanent in nature and not elassilied as Group R— I. R—2. R—4 or I. including:
I3ui Idings that do not contain more than two throbbing touts

‘are Fmcihncs tnat provide accommodations br six or Jew er persom recei\ ing care

Congregate living lacilities (nuniransieni with I b or fetter occupants

Boarding houses (noiltransient.)

C on emil S

Doria itorics

Fraternities and sororities

Monastery

Congregate living theiJitie (transient) \\ itil IC) or Jew er occupants

Boarding houses ( transient)

I .odiii ng houses ( transient ith live or fewer guest rooms and 10 or lewer occupants

Page 13 o158



310.4.1 Care ticiiities within a dwelling. Care lheiifties for Si\ or lewer persons recei\ lug care thai
are within a single—fhmilv dix citing are permitted to comply with the International Residential Code
provided an automatic sprinkler system is installed in accordance with Section 903.3. 1 .3 or xx jib
Section P290—I of the International Residential Code.

•
.. fl r AC Iectio,1 40.3.3.-. olliuaupi lit,’ r.jiCiustiits

An;enclseeuoii 403.5.4 to trod oslo/lows:

403.5.4 Smokeproof enclosures. Every required exit stairway serving floors more than 55_feet (16 764
mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall he a smokeproof enclosure in accordance
with Sections 909.20 and 1022.10.

41)6.3.3 Carports. Carports shall he open on not Jew er I han 1w o sides. C’tuports open on tcw er than
Iwo sides shall be considered a garage and sha] I compi\ xx i th the requirements thu private garages.

406.3.3.1 Carport separation. Separations shall compl with the ioilowmii:

1. A separation is not required between a Group R—3 and U carport. provided that the carport is
entnrly open on two or more sides and there are not enclosed areas above.

2. \Vlien a ( iroup [3. I . M. 1<. or S oecupanc structure and a noncomubustible carport arc located
on the same property with a minimutmni separation ol ten eel (304$ nun) between the structure and
the carport. as measured from the root edges. exterior wall and opening protection are not required (or
either struet ore

Rcri.se Stc;iuii 903.3. 1.2 In tetn/ (,\/uI/nhms:

91)3.3.12 NFP, I3R sprinkler systems. littoniutu sprinkLe sizctenis in Group R Occupancies tip to and
including two slories in height iii buildings no! exceeding (i() flct (IS 255 max) in height above graoe plane
shall be permitted to he installed thronghotit in accordance with \FPA I 3W

Ike number of stori cs i Group R occtmpane es constructed iii accordance xx ith Section
510.2 and 510.4 shall be meastired Irom the ho:i,nntal asembl\ creating separate btnldings.

Per/sc ,Sccnoti 903.210 tend aspi//mis:

903.2 Where required . Approved ujetoniotic jni,ikIer sisteins in new buildings and structures shall he
proxided throughout all buildings and structures. regardicss ot occupancy type and including htnldings
and structures in accordance witil the hitit:urio,:u/ Rcc’dcniiol (ode, which meet one ot the tollowing
requirements. and additionally in the locations tlescribcd in Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12:

For buildings constructed in accordance with the Jnte,nationa/ Building Code, approved automal mc
sprinklers systems are required where the building area exceeds 5.000 square feet (464 tn2)

2. For buildings constructed in accordance with the International Residential Code, approved
auroniolic spnnktet’ slstents are required where the living space exceeds 5.000 square feet (464 mj.

Page 14of58



C
3. For any buildings, not otherwise requinng fire sprinklers, where the available fire flow does not
meet the fire flow requirements of the International F/ic Code. approved automatic spi’nikler si-stems
shall be provided as required by the/be code official.

Section 1109.16 Baby Changing Tables for Permanent Building or Facility

Add new subsection to 1109.16:

1109.16 Baby Changing Tables for Penuanent Building or Facility.

A. Any new permanent building or facility used by’ the public that contains public restrooms and is
constructed on or after October 1, 2017, shall be equipped with at least one baby changing table.
Furthermore, if a baby changing table is not accessible in such a building or facility that contains a
lamily or assisted use restroom facilities available to both men and women, then at least one baby
changing table must bc accessible to men and at least one baby changing table must he accessible to
worn en.

B. The provisions in subsection A do not apply to the tbllowing:

1 . Any building or facility that does nol have a public restroom; or

2. 1—las been issued a permit or license that restricts the admission of’ children to the building or
facility on the basis of age.

Section 3102.7 Engineering Design

.4niend section 3102.7 to -‘ad as follo’as:

3102.7 Engineering design. The strLieture shall he designed and constructed to sustain dead loads: loads
due to tension or inflation: live loads including wind, snow, flood and seismic loads and in accordance with
Chapter 16.

Exception: Membrane structures intended to he in place for 30 days or less may be engineered to risk
category I loads provided the installation and use are per the manufacturers recommendations,

2018 International Residential BuiIdin2 Code

Section Rl01.1 Title

Amend sect/oil R 101.1 to i-cad as/olloit’s:

RIO I .1 Title. These provisions shall he known as the Rcsidc,ria/ (‘ode/or Gin’- and ‘lao- Tnn/lv fln’ci//i:g
and shall he cited as such and will he referred lo herein as “this code’’.

Page 15 of 58



C C
Section R1O1.2 Scope

4n;enc/ see/iou RIO].2 to read oslo/ions

RI01.2 Seopg
The provisions of the Jn!ernateona/ Residential Code/or Onc’— ceuid loo—Iaind’ i): c/Hugs, shall apply to the
construction. alteration, movement, enlargement. replacement, repair. ec1nnpuien,. use and occupancy.
location, removal and demolition of detached one— and tvo—fatnily dwellings and toim’uuiionses not more than
three stories above Ru-adcpiaiic’ in height with a separate means ot egress and their acecssoil strI(Ct1tle5 not
more than three storcs above i’<eclc’ plau;e in heighr Where this code refers to codes not auoptecl by the
jurisdiction, the appl waNe code adopted by the j urisdiction shall govern.

leR30l,2l)

:uuiend lab/c’ J?30!. 2(1) and ella/u gna,’/oolnotes d’, “g’’ and ‘n

WIND
DESIGN

CLIMATIC

Seiiii
C

Dcsigi
(‘aIegc’i

0’ In
4 D

\\ inler

270 F
:,CIl1-II11
Cr

\IotIcin I 12’ F

Ii) 45011
In

I ICI\\ 60011

\\ oiler
50

F
Suniii

9PF

FLOO LI
HAZ-\R

DS

For SI: 1 pound p squai-e hot 0.1)479 kPa. I mile P hour = 0.447 in s.

C.R() \
LI
SN O\\
LI )A D
c-)

TABLE R30l.2(l)
AND GEOGRAPI-IIC DESIGN CRITERIA

Sjice
a
(I

nph

1 opograplll
c cI’feci,.

SUBjECT TO DA\1AGF
FRO.\i

S pee a
I ‘0111(1

Icg Ion

0<2000’

\vin dOom
C dchrH

ZOJ1C

115

e, 0 en ii

No

F CON’

Inic
de1itli

1)

‘I ei-iii i
C

No

5

Ice
— r

BonnierDes,
IC Underl

ii
ayiiICri

1 e,ii,

i C
Rcqcim

cii H

No D 0

No

Negligible

AIR
IRE ELI

NG
INDEX

No

\IL\N
AN N U
AL
TEM P

D

I ‘<5000’

0 NcgIigib!e I ‘<5000’

No 1501)

I BC IBC No

6000’

663°
Fc * ( I 500 66 30

No —j—moj-63z
‘IFS * 2000 45 10

lB
C

BC lB
C

\IANUAL J

I BC

DFSIGN CRITERIA

I BC
B
C’

Page 16 ot 58



( (
a. Where weathering requires a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy

the structural requirements of this code, the frost line depth strength required for weathering shall
govern. The weathering column shall be tilled in with the weathering index. “negligible.” “moderate”
or ‘severe’ for concrete as deterniinecl from Figure R301 .2(4). The grade of masonry units shall be
determined from ASTM C 34, C 55, C 62, C 73, C 90, C 129, C 145, C 216 or C 652.

b. Where the [lost line depth may require deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403. 1 (1). the
frost line cleijth strength required for weathering shall gox-erri. The jurisdiction shall fill in the frost
line depth column with the minimum depth of footing below finish grade.

c. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on
whether there has been a history of local subterranean termite damage.

d. The jurisdiction shall fill in tlus part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map
[FigureR3Ol .2 (5) A]. Wind exposure category shall be selected as “category C’’ unless the applicant
provides a detailed justification on how the exposure category is determined on a site-specific basis
in accordance with Section R30l .2.1.4.

e. The outdoor design dry-bulb temperature shall be selected from the columns of 97 12-pcrcent values
for winter from Appendix D of the

f. mien at/anal P/mob/ag Code. Deviations from the Appendix D temperatures shall be permitted to
reflect local climates or local weather experience as determined by the building official. [Also see
Figure R301.2 (I).]

g. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category’ determined from
Section R301.2.2.l.

Ii. September 27, 2002. “The Flood Insurance Study’ for Nyc County’. Nevada and Incorporated Areas’’.
as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood
Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related supporting data along with any revisions thereto.

I. In accordance with Sections R905.l.2. R905.4.3.l, R9t35.5.3.l. R905.6.3.l. R905.7.3.l and
R058.3. 1. where there has been a history of local claniage from the effects of ice damming. the
jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES.’’ Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill in this
part of the table with ‘‘NO.’’

j. The jurisdiction shall fill in this part ofthe table with the I 00—year return period1 air freezing index (BE—
days) from FigLire R403.3 (2) or from the I 00—year (99%) value on the National Climatic Data Center
data table “Air Freezing Index- USA Method (Base 32° F).”

k. The jurisdiction shall fill in this pail of the table with the mean annual temperature from the National
Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32F).”

1. In accordance with Section R301 .2.1.5, where there is local historical data documenting structural
damage to buildings due to topographic wind speed—up effects, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part
of the table with ‘‘YES.’’ Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate ‘‘NO’’ in this part of the tableS

nt. In accordance with Figure R30l .2(5)A. where there is local historical data documenting unusual wind
conditions, the jurisdiction shall fill in this of the table with ‘‘YES’’ and identify’ any specific
requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

n. In accordance with Section R30l .2.1.2 the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-borne debris wind
zone(s). Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

o. Manual i and the 2018 IECC shall be used to fill in these values.
p. The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in figure R30l .2 (6)

Table R301-5

Page 17 of 58



C C
Amend lab/u R3Ol .. oslo/Ions:

TABLE R301.5

rHinhabitable attics \vjthoageh

Uninhabitable attics with limited storage b,g 20
Habitable attics and attics served with fixed stairs 40

Balconies (exteiioi) and decks 40

r Fn escapes

____ _________

4 40

Guards and handrails d ,00h

Guard in-fill components 50h1

Passenger vehicle garages a 50a

Rooms other than sleeping rooms 0 —

Sleeping rooms

i. \\herc it can be determined in designing the floor that the actual li e load iil he greater than the \ alue
show a in Table R30l .5. the actual live load shall be used in the design of such buildings or portions
thereof Special provisions shall he made lhr machine and apparatus loads.

Section R301.6 Roof Loads
.1n,end section R30]. 6 by adding a second sentence to read as/a/Ions:

14301.6 Roof load. The roof shall be designed lir the live load indicated in Fable R301 .6 or the
snow load indicated in Table R30 1.2(1). whchever is greater. Roof live loads in accordance with Section
1607.13 of ihe 201 S International Buihling Code may he used in place of the loads in table R301 .6

Section R302.1 Exterior Walls

Revise section R$fll.6 to tead as/a/ions:

R302. I Exterior Walls. Construction. projections. openings and pel1etrflioi1s of eutcnoi ira/Is of
dwellings and aecessor\ buildings shall comniv with Table R302. 1 (1): or due/hogs equipped throughout
with an automatic sInaI/i/cl sisteiii installed in accordance with Section P2904 or \ EPA 13— D shall
comply with Table R302. I (2). For use of this lable. fire separation dislanee in the field shall he
measured from the lot line to the fbundation.

Pagc IS



C CException:
1 . \Val Is. projections. opemngs or penetrations in walls perpendjcular to the line used to determine the

tire separation distance.
2. Walls of individual dwelling units and their accessory structures located on the same lot.
3. Detached tool sheds and storage sheds. playhouses and similar structures exempted from pennits are

not required to provide xvall protection based on loeaton on the lot. Project ions hevond the exterior
wall shall not ext end over the lot line.

4. Detached garages accessory to a dwelling located within 2 feet (61 0 mm) of a lot line are permitted to
have roof cave projections not exceeding 4 inches ( 02 mm).

5. Foundation vents installed in compliance \\ ith this code are pcrmttted.

TABLE R302.l (I) EXTERIOR WALLS

MINIMUM MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR \VAI.L ELEMENT FIRE-RESISTANCE RATING SEPARATION DISTANCE

I hour-tested in accordance with ASTN I
El 19. I. 263 or Section 703.3 of the

Fire—resi stance rated Jntenia/,oj:uI Bui/dnig C rn/c with 0 feet
. cx pos lire irorn both sidesWalls (c) -

Not lire—resistance
—t) hours > I eetrated

I Not allowed NA
. E7 fret

. . I liourontlieunderside. or heavy tiniher. . —I re-resistance rated - >2 feel to K) feet. . or tire- etardaut-treated wood (a).(h))j.ç) leelions

Not flit—resistance 0 hours >5 feet

Not allowed NA <3 feel
.

. 25°1 niaxiniuin oIwalI (1 Iwiurs 3feet( )peinns iii wails .

Pcntti ations
N one req u i red .‘ teet

For SI: I foot 304.8 mm. N A = Not Applicable.
a. The tirc-resEslanee rating shall he permitted to he reduced to 0 hotirs on the underside of the cave overhang

it tue hlock:ng is provided from the wall top plate to the understdc (it the roof shealhinu.
b. Jhe lire—resistance rating shall he permitted to be reduced to 0 hours on the underside of the rake overhang

where gahl e vent openings are not i istal led.
e, Enrated exterior tirislies shall not puen more than 4 inches into the fire separation distance.

Section R307.1 Space Required

Reuse Section 1607. Ito icad as/o//ois:

R307.1 Space required. Fixtures shall he spaced in accordance with UPC section 402.5
Section R313.1 Townhouse Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems

Piige 19 ofSS



C
Revise Section R3 13.1 and R313.2 and add section 1?3 13.3 as/bilows:

R313.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems. An automatic rcsdentiai fire sprinkler svsteq
shall he installed in roiinhouses where the I/i/n space of the building exceeds 5.000 square feet 1465
In area.

Exception: An automatic residential fire system shall not be required where additions or alterations are
maclu’ to existing townhouses that (10 not have an automatic residential he sprinkler system installed.

R313.1.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential tue sprinkler systems for townhouses shall
he designed and installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NFPA 13 D.

R3 13.2 One— and two—family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems .An automatic resiclenia? fire
snriikl er system shall he installed in one— and I \vo—1 am i lv diei/in-.s where the i/i ‘ing .cjicc’ ot the building
exceeds 5.000 scitmare feet 465 in area.

Exception: An automatic residential tire system shall not be required für udduio;m.s or aite;atioirs
made to existing buildings that are not already provmdeci with an automatic residential fire sprinkler
system.

R3 13.2.1 Design and installation. Automatic residential lime sprinkler systems for one— and ttvo—fami lv
dve/ling$ shall be designed and installed in accordance with Section P2904 or NE l’A I 3D.

R313.3 hue Son. For -tmnv building nut otherwise required to provide lire sprinklers. where the
available time fIo\r does not meet the fire how requirements of’ the 2018 III’. approved automatic
sprinkler S\ stems shall be pros ided as required by the lire code oflicial -

Section R3 15.2.2 Alterations, repairs, and additions

Revise subsection 1615.2.2 to i-cad as/h/bus:

R315.22 Alterations repairs and additions. \\]cre akciitian.c. i-c/ia/i-s or addnioiìs requiring a permIt
occur, the uuhrulud due/i/ut,’ uaiit shall be equipped with cam-hon monoxide alarms located as required or
ml ew (IIm el/ui” s -

Exceptions:

- Work im,yol\ing the exterior surfaces or dircllintn. such as the replacement of roohng or sichng. or the
addtioa or replacement of windows or doors. 0: the addition ofa porch or deck.

2. Installation, alteration or repairs of plumbing. or nontuel tired nueehani cal systems.

Section R401.3 Drainage

Section R401.$ is deleted ui its cu:ti,-’cti- and replaced uith a new section R401.3 to i-cad ac/o/bon-s:

R40 1.3 Drainage. The ground immediately adjacent to the foundation shall he sloped away from the
building at a slope of not less than one unit vertical iii 20 units horizontal 5—percent siope for a
minimum distance of I 0 feet ( 304S mm) measured perpemKlicmr to the lice of the wail. If ph\ sical

Pae2Oof58



C C
obstructions or lot lines prohibit 1(3 feet (3048mm) of horizontal distance. a 5—percent slope shall be
provided to an approved alternative method of diverting water away from the foundation. Swales used
for this purpose shall be sloped a minimum o 1 percent along the flow line where located within I 0
feet (3048mm) of tile building thundation. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet ( 3048mm) of the
hnlding foundation shall he sloped a minimum of 2 percent away from the building.

Exception: Where low expansive, low collapsible. low soluble soil conditions occur or where an
exterior asphalt or concrete surface abtits a bujlding. the slope of the ground away from the building
thundation is peanit ted to he reduced to not less titan one unit vertical in 48 units (2-percent slope).

The procedLire used to establish the final ground level adjacent to the foundation shall account for
additional settlement of the bacltll

Section R401 .4 Soil Test

Section 114014 is deleted in its cu/i ‘civ and replaced nit/i (1 new sec/ion R401.4 to read as follows:

401.4 Soil tests MI strLicturcs or auditions shall have a soils gcotcchnical reports conipl\inu with
the 2018 IBC Chapter 18.

Exception: Piojects listed ii the 2(11 S I BC Section I 803.2 All projects shall cOiflll!\ with 20 I S I
Section 1803.1

Section R401.5 grading Plans

Insert a ncir section 11401.5 to read asfo//oiis:

R406.2 Concrete and masonry foundation waterproofing. When the approved geotechnieal report
indicates there is a high—water table or other severe soil—water conditions are known to exist, exterior
Inundation walls that retain earth and enclose interior spaces and floors below gu’adc shall be
waterproofed from the higher of (a) the top of the footing or (h) 6 inches (1 52 mm) below the top of the
basement floor, to the finished gi’ode. Walls shall be waterproofed in accordance with one of the following:

Two—ply hot mopped felts.
2. Fifty-five pound (25 kg) roll rooting.
3. 1 0—util (0.254 mm) polyvinyl chloride.
4. 1 0—mU (0.254 mm) polyethylene.
5. Forty—mi I (1 mm) polymer—modified asphalt.
6. Sixty-mil (1.5 mm) flexible polymer cement.
7. One—eighth inch (3 mm) cement—based. Fiber—reinforced, waterproof coating.
8. Sixty-mU (1.5 mm) solvent free liquid—applied synthetic rubber

All joints in membrane waterproofing shall be lapped and sealed with an adhesive compatible with
the membrane

Exception: Organic—solvent—based products such as hydrocarbons, chlorinated hydrocarbons. kctones and
esters shall not be used for ICF walls \\ ith expanded polystyrene form material. Use of plastic roofing
cements. acrylic coatinus. latex coatings. mortars and par :igs to seal ICF val Is is permitted. Coid—setti ng

Page 2] ofSS



C C
asphalt or hot asphalt shall conform to type C of AST\ I D 449 I {o asphalt shall he applied at a
temperature of less than 200°F (93°C).
Section R506.2.3 Vapor retarder

Revise Section R5062.3 Vapor i’etai’dei’ to read as follows

R506.2.3 Vapor retarder. A 10 mit (0.010 inch; 025 mm) polyethylene or approved vapor retarder
conforming to ASTM E 1745 Class A requirements with joints lapped not less than 6 inches (152 mm)
shaH be placed between the concrete floor slab and the base course or the prepared subgrade where no base
course exists.

Exceplion The vapor retarder is not required for the ihllowing:

From garages, utility buildings and other unheated accessory strucflii’cs
2. For unheated storage moms ha\ ing an area of less than 70 sqaare feet (6.Snr) and caiports.
3. Driveways, walks, patios and other flatwork not likely to be enclosed and heated at a later date.
4. Where apn’oved hr the buik/iiç’ u//ic/al. based on local site conditions

Section R807.1 Attic Access

Revise Section R$07.] Attic access to i-cad as Jo/lows

R807. I Attic access. Buildings with combustible ceiling or root construction shall have at least one tittie
access opening. Additional access openings shall be provided to attic areas that have electrical, plumbing.
or mechanical fixtures or equipn ent that i-equ -e access for periodic nunntenanee.

Exception: Access opcnins are not required for non—contiguous enclosed attic spLices that di not ha\ e
plumbing. mechanical. or electrical components that require access Hr periodic maintenance.
ihe rough—framed opening shall be not less than 22 I nclics liv 30 inches (559 mm by 762mm) and
shall lie located in a hallway or other location with I-Lath’ access, where located in a wall. the openinu
sha] I be not less than 22 inches wtde by 3t) inches high (559mm by 762mm). \\‘here the access is
located in a ceiling. minimum LI:iobtrueted headroom in the tUlle space shall be 30 inches (762
olin) at some point above the access measured vertically li’oni the bottom of’ the ceiling ham i ng
meniber. See 201 S U MC 904. 10 for access requirements where mechanical equipment is located in
attics,

Section R905.7 Wood Shingles

Delete Section R905. 7 in its entire/i- and replace as/b/lou-s

R005.7 \\‘ood shingles. 1 he installation of \ ow,i shingles is not permitted.

Section R905.8 Wood Shakes

Delete Section R905.8 in its entire/v and replace as/bl/oirs

R905.8 Wood Shakes The installation of wood shakes is not permitted.

Page 22 ofSS



( (
Section R1007 Fireplaces and Appliances

4(1(1 Seciton RI (107 I-i cplaccc mid :1ilUhlCLS. add!? 1008 5m’cia! Fà’cj’lacu and .4?yltaiiec’ RcqiiI,’c/IicilI (/S
follows:

RI 007.1 Types of fireplaces

RI 007.l T pes of fireplaces. No sohd luel burning fireplace shaH be constructed in any residential
dwelling in Nyc County at an elevation of less than 4000 feet (1220 m) above sea level Lmless it is one of
the following:

RI 007.1.1 A dedicated solid fuel burning factory—built enclosed fireplace or iacorv—built heater that
conforms to the Phase II Environmental Protection Agency, Standards of Pcrfhrmancc for New
Stationary Sources. New Residential f-leaters’’ as prescribed in 40 (‘ER Part 60. Subpart AAA. as venhed
by a nationally recognized I sting approved by the Building Official.

141007.1.2 A masonry fireplace or masonry heater constructed in accordance with Chapter tO or a
factory—built fireplace shall include one of the fbllowing:

the installation ol a nood—bririiiinj in,ert which meets the standards described in RI 007.1.1 of
this subsection and which shall be installed m accordance with the manufacturers instructions.

2. 1 he installation of gas logsw ith a natonallv recognized hsting and approved by the Building Official.

2. Ihe Ii replace opening shall he completely enclosed with a cover ot solid glass, steel, or cast it-on.
The covering may be either solid or openable.

3. A caution sign shall be pcrmancntl> installed and maintained where it is readily visible at all times.
Eke sign shall state: “Caution: approved for fuel gas usc only. Damper shall remain pciminently
blocked open.’’

4. The letters on the sign shall be a mininmni of3 N inches in height.

RI 007.2 Types of’ appliaflces Ihe following appliances shall be provided with a nationally
recognized listing approved 1w the Building ()t1ical wior to i:stal1r1tion:

1 . Deco rat i c electrical appliance

2. Decorative \ ented gas appliance

3. Deeoriith un-vented gas appliance or heater

Section [41008 Special Fireplace and Appliance Requirements.

Ri 008.1 Installation within a (In cuing unit Au fireplace or appliance installations within a dw clling
unit shall comply with the following requirements:

1. If the fireplace or gas appliance is located in a sleeping room or an adjacent bathroom, then a

Page 23 u: 58



C
permanent, unobstructed fresh air supply shall be provided directly’ from the exterior of the
structure to the fire box.

2.The supply duct shall be a minimum 4” (102mm) or as directed in the manufacturer’s listing.

Exception:

• A decorative electrical appliance
2. Un—vented heater that is specifically listed for sleeping rooms
3. All decorative gas or electrical appliances shall comply with their listing and the manufacturer’s

installation instruction.

Section: Deleted Chapters

Dc/etc chop/ci:c /Jth;ough 22 curl 24 tluoiç h 43 in their en file/i eve!ucluig see/ion P2904.

Section R806.5

.-In,end Jab/c R,S()a. 5 as/c/lows:

MININIUM RIDGED BOARI) ON AIR

_________

CLINIKI’E ZONE IMPERMEABLE_INSULATION R-VALUE
8,1)

________ _________

213 and 313

_______________________

0 (none rcqcfJ)

_____

I, 2A. 2B, 3A. 3C

____
____

R-5

_____________

4c

____ ____________

R-lO

___

4A.413 R-15

_________

5

___________________

R-20

_____

6

___________

R-25

_____ _____

7

________ ___________

R-30

____________

__ __

S

__

I

___
_

__

Section P2904.2.3 Freezing areas

Rn ?Se Seetio, P2904.2.3, (IS

Section P2904.2.3 Freezing areas. Piping in unconditioned spaces shall be protected from freezing
wEth a minimum of R—2 insulation. \Vhere sprinklers are required in areas that are subject to freezing.
dry—sidewall or drv—pcndent sprinklers extending from a nonireezing area into a freezing area shall be
installed.

Page 24 or58



(
Appendix II — Patio Covers

.1 iopi :Ippcndix 11 — Palm C m irs

Appen (lix 1< — So 1111(1 Trausmission

1iloji-lppeizdix f — So anti J ;am ,nis.cion

Section R806.5

1 iIiCH(/ Tobk’ RS06.5 OS/OifOia:

IJNJM UM RIDGED BOARD ON JR-RIPE RMEABLE

CLIMATE ZO*Z INSULATION R-VALUE

2 B and 3 B 1) (none required

L - L 2A. lB. 3A .3Q

! 4A.4B R-l5

5 R-2()

6 R-25

7

Section P2904.2.3 Freezing areas

11cr/cc’ Secluni P290r[ 2J, as b/ions:

Section P2904.2.3 Freezing areas. Pipin2 iii unconditioned spaces shall be protected foam Ileezing with a
minimum ol [<—2 insulation. Where sprinklers are required in areas that are subject to freezing, div—sidewall
or dry—pendent sprinklers e.\tcndi ng from a nonlreeziiig area into a tieeii nu area shall he installed

Appendix II — Patio Covets

4 dOJJl -Ippciidv i-i Pano Cores

.Appei dix h — Sound Iransruission

1t/ofl .-lppciicltv K — $onnd / iviisniission

2015 International Energy Conservation Code

Pdgc 25 at 58



Section C202 Definitions

Add definition of Luminaire, as follows:

LUMINAIRE: A complete lighting unit consisting of a light source, such as a lamp or lamps.
together with the pails designed to position the light source and connect it to the power supply. ft
may also include parts to protect the light source or the ballast or to distribute the light. The individual
components of a luminaire (i.e., lamp. ballast, driver, reflector, etc.) do not constitute a luminaire.

Section 301.1 General: Climate zones from Figure C30l .1 or Table C30l.l shall he used in determining
the applicable requirements from Chapters 4. Locations not in Table C30l .1 (outside the United States)
shall be assigned a climate zone based on Section C301 .3.

ENception: Areas within this jurisdiction above altitudes of 4000 feet shall be considered in Climate
Zone 5B. Below 4000 feet elevation shall be considered climate Zone 3B.

Section C402.5.9
Add new section C402.5.9. as follows:

(:402.5.9 Air (:urtains. \\‘hcre doorvav. passage\vLly or pass—thiti Openings in the building thermal
envelope ai-e intended to he normally open to the exterior environment, an approved air curtain tested
in accordance with ANSI•’AMCA 220 shall be used to separate conditioned air from the exterior.

Section (:405.2.4
Revise section 405.2.4 to add an exception, as follows:

(405.2.4 Specific application controls. (Remains unchanged)

Exceptions:
Lighting and switched receptacles controlled by card key controls.

I Spaces where patient care isdirectlv proxided.
3. Bathroom lighting within sleeping units.

Section (.405.3.1

nen inn; 21) to the SLTO)7(/ p’11’ü°n,11J’ 0/ .S1c7101? ‘. 15./110’

(‘405.3.1 Total connected Interior lighting power.

20. Cheine ‘entertainment elements in thcine:amusemcnt parks and casinos.

Section C405.4.l

Modify Exception No, 11 in Section C405.4. 1, as follows:

C405.4.1 Total connected exterior building exterior lighting power. The total exterior connected
lighting power shall be the total maximum rated wattage of all lighting that is powered through the energy
service for the building.

Pie 26 o58



/ CS.

Exception:
1. Lighting used for the following applications shall not be included through 10. (Remains unchanged)
2. 11. Theme/entertainment elements in theme/amusement parks and casinos through 14. (Remains

unchanged)

Section C-108.3.1

Pci/sc 408.3. 1, us/of/mis:

C408.3.1 Functional Testing. Prior to passing final inspection, the registered design professional
or other agency or means approvcd by the jurisdiction shall provide evidence that the lighting
control systems have been tested to ensure that control hardware and software are calibrated.
adjusted. programmed and in proper vorLing condition in accordance with the consnitction
dociuneins and iuanufacurers instructions. Functional testing shall he in accordance with Sections
C408.3 .1.1 through C408.3.l.3 for the applicable control type.

Section C503.6

Revise section (503.6 to add an exception. as/allows:

C503.6 Lighting systems. New lighting systems that are part of the aliciation shall comply with
Section C405.
Exception:

Alterations that replace less than 10 percent of the luin i naires in a space. provided that such
alterations do not increase the installed interior lihting poer.

2 . Alterations that replace only the bulb and ballast within the existing luminaires in a space,
provided that the alteration does not increase the installed interior lighting power.

Section R301.1

Add e.Veep!io;z to scelioji, as/of/mis:

R301.1 General. Climate zuies from Figure R301 .1 or Table R301 .1 shall be used for
determining the applicable requirements from Chapter 4. Locations not indicated in Table
P301.1 shall be assigned a climate zone in accordance with Section R301 .3.

Except ion:
Areas within Nyc County above altitudes of 4000 feet shall be considered in Climate Zone 5.
Areas within Nyc County below altitudes of 4000 feet shall he considered in Climate Zone 3.

Section R403.6

.4dd exception to the section, as/ol/oii’s:

R403.6 Mechanical ventilation (Mandatory). The building shall be provided with ventilation that
complies with the requirements of the International Residential Code or Lint/OlIN Mechanical

Page 27 ot 58



Code, as applicable, or with other approved means of ventilation. Outdoor air intakes and exhausts
shall have automatic or gravity dampers that close when the ventilation system is not operating.

Exception: Where clothes dryer exhaust vents terminate vertically at the roof, back draft dampers are
not permitted.

2018 Uniform Mechanical Code

Section 304.3.1 .2 Permanent Lad (let’s

1?cii.c .cctnni 30-/. 3 1.2 to read as /àlloirs:

304.3.1.2 Permanent Ladders. Permanent ladders required by Section 304.3. 1 . I or exterior ladders
shall he constructed in accordance with the tol lowing:

1. Side railings shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) above the roof or parapet wall.
2. Landings shall not exceed 18 feet (5486 mm) apart measured from the linished grade.
3. Width shall he not less than 14 inches (356 ram) on cenler.
4. Rungs spacing shall not exceed 12 inches (305 mm) on center, and each rung shall he capable

ofsupporting a 300—pound (136.1 kg) load.
5. [oe space shall he not less than 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:
1. Permanent ladders providing roof access need not extend closer than eight (8) feet (2438 mm)

to the finish grade.
2. A portable ladder may’ be used for access for a Group ft Division 3 and 4 and U occupancies.
3. Permanent ladders for equipment access need nol be provided at parapets or walls less than

tIn liv (30) inches (762mm) in height.

Section 304.4 Appliances iii Allies and Under—Floor Spaces

Re rise Sectioii 304.4 (IS Jo/lots:

304.4 Appliances in Attics and Under—Floor Spaces. Au attic or under—floor space in which an
appi iatice is nstal I ccl shall be accessible through an opening and passage—w av not I ess thatx the
largest component ol the appliance, and the rnigh—ti’anicd opening shall not he less ilian 22 inches Nv
30 inches 559 mm by 762mm).

Section 401.2 Ventilation Required

Aniend Section 401.2 to read as/b/bits:

401.2 Ventilation required. Every occupied space shall be ventilated by natural means in accordance
with Section 402 or by mechanical means in accordance with Section 403. Where the air infiltration
rate in a dwelling unit is less than 5 air changes per hour when tested with a blower door at a pressure
of 0.2—inch water column (50 Pa) in accordance with Section 402.4. .2 of the International Energy
Conseii’atioi: Code. the dwelling unit shall be ventilated by mechanical means in accordance with
Section 403.

Page 28 o158



( C
Section 5044 Clothes Divers

Revise Section 504.4 1w addnig a new cvceptton. asfol/o:s:

Exception: \\hen iiioi store exI)aList duets tenn nate vertically through a root. backdraft dampers
are not required.

Section 504.4.2. 1— Length I mi Lotion

Rc’/sc Section 504.4.2. 1 a;ien exception, as/of/mis:

594.4.2.1 Lenglh Limitation. Lnless otherwise peruired or req nired h the diver
in anutact u rer’s instructions and approved by the Authori tv [1 aving Jurisdiction. doni esti c dryer
moisture exhaust ducts shall not exceed a total combined horizontal and vertical length of 14
feet (4267 mm). including two 90—degree (I .57 rad) elbows. A length of 2 feet (61 0 mm) shall
lie deducted for each 90—degree (1 .57 ad) elbow in excess o F two.

I: \eeptions:

(I) Where an exhaust duet power ventilator. in accordance with Section 504.2.3. is used, the
penuitted length o the dryer exhaust duet shall he permtted to be m accordance with tile dryer
exhaust duet pover ventilator manufacturer’s iistaIhttoi instructions.

(2) Lengths may lie increased when justiFied h calculations piepred liv a Nevada licensed
Nice ha ni cal E ng neer.

Section 505.3 Makeup Air

.iinend section 505.3 to tend as/v/bus:

505.3 Makeup Air. Makeup air shall he provided to replenish air exhausted by the ventilator system.
Exhaust hood systems capable of exhausting in excess of 600 cfrn (0.2$ m3/s) shall he provided with
iiiakeiçri an at a rate approximately equal to the exla its? air rate. Such iiiakc’np ciii’ systems shall be
equipped with a means of closure and shall he automatically controlled to start and operate
simultaneously with the exhaust system. Makeup air inlakes shall he located so as to avoid
recireulation of contaminated air within enclosures.

Scction 510.1.6.1 Bracing and Supports

Ac/rb a new 5cction SJt). 1.6. 1. as/v/lows:

510. Lx) Bracing and Supports. t. nless spechcall\ listed, the struetura) supporb tor a duet
enclosure shall he outside the enclosure.

Section 5 112.2.1.1 Performance Test

.444 anew .Seeiuni 511.2.:.).! as/n/lows:

Pac 29 o’58



C
511.2.2.1.1 Performance Test. The permit holder shall provide the jurisdiction with an accurate.
completed. and signed test report. The report shall he on a form supplied b the jurisdiction or on
a form containing equivalent iii tormation. At the discretion of the building official, the
performance test may he required to be uitnesscd by the Authority 11 flying J tirisdiction,
performed by an approved third-party testing agcncy

Section 603.4.1 Length Limitation

Dc/u/u .vcc’lioI/ 6(13.4. I

Section 61)3. I3Air I)ispersion Systems

Revise section 603. 13. as follows:

603. 13 Air Dispersion Systems. Where insta! lcd. air dis crsion systems shall be complelcl v
insta led in exposed locations operate under positi \e prcssure. and not pass throngli or penetrate
fire—resistant—rated construction. Airdispci’sion s stems shall be litcd and labeled in accordance
with Lb 251$.

Sect iou 608.1 A ii toni a tie SItu toll’s

Ru i’i su Sc’e/ion 6/IA. 1 hr adc/m (I 1/Cl I /)(Uc1t1’tI/)/l/O/k)irflhtZ Tile uxc’eplflni.s. its to//ui iv:

Upon completion and hctore final approval of the tn-moving system provided with the required
smoac uctcctors. a performance test shall he pcriormcd to xcri l\ complianec of detector
installation to manulacturers instructions and system compatibility as speciticd in this chapter.
The permit holder shall flirn ish the necessary test eq ui pnient and devices i-eq ui red to perform the
tests and shall proide the jurisdiction with an aecuratc. completed. and signed test report. ‘[he
rcpa’t shall be on a lorm suppijed b the Jurisdiction or on a torni containing equivalent
infhrmation At the discretion ottlic btnlding official, the per tornancc test ma be requred to he
witnessed by the Authority Having Jui’isdictioii. perlornicd by an approved third—party testing
agency.

Section 802.6. 1 Termination Req nirements

Add an exception to 802.6.1(1) toreacl as follows:

8(32 .6.1 Termin ation Requirements. A gas cnt shall terminate in accordance with one of the
II ow in a

- Gas
vents that are 12 inches (300 mm) or less ü size and located not less than 8 feet (243$ mm) from
a vertical wall or similar obstruction shall terminate above the roof in accordance with Figure
802.6.1 andTahle 802.6.1.

Exception: A single—fdmi lv residence having gas vents twel c (12) inches (300 mm in Si/C or
snialler with listed cups shall he permit ted to he terminated in accordance with Figure 802.6. I

Page 30 of 58



C
provided the)’ are at least four (4) feet (I .2 In) from a vertical wall or similar obstruction.

Items tli through (7) remain unchanged.

Section Chapter 10, Boilers and Pressu i-c Vessels

Delete C/au qct lout ifs eat lie/i deep! .5cc/ion 1(11)1. 11(11(1 ieli.VC eclioii lull). i, asfö/hni:
1001.1 Applicability. For boilers and water heaters less than 120-gallon capacity, or a BTU input
rating less than 200,000, or less than 160 pounds per square inch of pressure. see Chapter 5 of the
Uniform Plumbing Code. For all other units, contact the Mechanical Section of the Nevada Division
of Occupational Safety and Health, pail of the Office of Business and Industrial Relations.

Evccprion.c (1) ihi’otçgi: (8) i’einaiii tow/lunged.

Section 1301.2 Dry Gas

Add a neli section /301.2. as/à1/oiis:

1301.2 Dry Gas. Southern Nevada shall be considered a dry gas condition having a moisture and
hydrocarbon dev point below any normal temperature to which the gas piping is in an exposed
area. unless specified by- the local gas purveyor.

Section 1310.1.6 Piping Underground Ileneath Buildings

1310.1.6 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings. No gas piping shtil I be instal led in or on the
ground under any building or structure unless installed in gastight conduit, and all exposed gas piping
shall he kent at least six (6) inches (1 52 mm) above grade or structure. the tenn building or
structure’’ shall include structures such as porches and steps. whether covered or uncovered,
breezcways. roofed porte-cochercs. roofed patios, carports, covered walks, covered driveways, and
similar structures or appurtenances . All gas piping under a slab shall be callable ofheing
removed and replaced.

The conduit shall be of material approved for installation underground beneath buildings and not less
than Schedule 40 pipe. The interior diameter of the conduit shall be not less than one—hal 1(1/2) inch

1 5 mn) larger than the outside diameter oftlie gas pipingS

The conduit shall extend to a point at least (12) inches (305 mm) beyond any area where it is required
to he installed or to the outside wall of a building, and the outer ends shall not be sealed. Where
the conduit terminates within a building, it shall be readily’ accessible and the space between the
conduit and the gas piping shall be sealed to prevent leakage of gas into the building.

Exception: Products hsted for such usc.

2012 Uniform Plumbin2 Code

Section 310.4 Use of vent and waste pipes

.41,: ciidscci ion 3 1(1.41(1 ic It/us Jo I/o its:

Piigc3l ofSS



(
3 I 0.4 Use of vent and waste pipes. Except as hereinafter provided in Sections 908.0. 909.0 and 9 I 0.0.
no vent pipe shall he used as a soil or waste pipe. nor shall a soil or w aste pipe be used as a vent.

Exception: Single stack D\VV systems may be used prov:ded they are desianed by a \cvada registered
Mechanical Engineerand approved bvthe authority havtngarisdiction.

Section 4112 Water (:onstiinption

Delete section 411.2 in its entirety and replace nit/i new section that reads as follows:

4 I 1.2 Water Consumption. \\ater closets, either flush tank. flushoineter tank. or tl ushoneter valve
operated. shall have an average consumption of 1.6 gallons (6.! liters) of water per flush. A timing
dcvice or other mechanism winch will automatically flush a water closet periodtcally or continually

Section 412. 1 II ‘ate,’ (‘onsuniption

/ )elt’te .s cc ‘i/oIl 4/2. / iii its cu/nc! U itiidi’’jiIcicc ti//i a IU1 ‘sec/ia/i that ict idc as/n/lairs:

4 2.1 Water Consumption. Urinals slut! I have an average water consuinpi ion of I gallon (3.8
liters) of water flush. A timing device or other mechLnlisnl which vi 11 automatically flush a
urinal periodically or continually is proluhitecl.

Section 41(9.3 location of i/api’ ih’ai,ts

Rei’isc’ .5cc/ion 4/r 3. as /n//ntis:

418.3 Location of Floor I)rain.s. Floor drains shall be installed ni Idliow ing locations:

I . Toilet rooms containing two or more water closets or a combination of own water closet and one
urinal, expect in a dw ci Ii ng unit.

2. Commercial kitchens and in accordance with Section 704.3.

3. Laundry rooms in commercial building and common laundry facilities in multi—family dwelling
buildings.

4. Boiler rooms.

5. Al I Fire PuHip rooms shall be provided with a (3) inch (76 mm) ni inimuni floor drain which
must he connected to an approved trap primer.

Section 422.0 \ litumu m N timber of Required FiittLres

Delete sections 422.1 through 422.5and Table 422, liii theirentiretv and replace with new section 422.
1, to read as Jo//on’s:

422.1 Fixture Count Plumbing fixtures shall be provided for the type of occupancy and in the
minimum number as required h’ the currently adopted Building Code.

Page 32 ot 58



C C
Section 507.13 Installation in Residential Garages

Reuse section 507.13 to read as follows:

507.13 Installation in Residential Garages. Appliances in residential garages and in adjacent
spaces that open to the garage and are not part of the living space of a dwelling unit shall be
installed so that all burners, elements, thermostats and burner—ignition devices are located not less
than 18 inches (457mm) above the floor unless listed as flammable vapor ignition resistant.
(NFPA 54:9.110.1)

Section 508.32 Access Type

Add adinioial paragr( tpli lo Seen n 508.3.2:

508.3.2 Access Type. Tie inside means of access shall he a pennanent or fold away inside stairway
or ladder, terminating in an enclosure, scuttle, or trap door. Such scuttles or trap doors shall have a
rough framed opening not less than 22 inches by 24 inches (559mm by 610 mm) shall open easily’ and
safely under all conditions, especially snow and shall be constructed so as to permit access from the
roof side unless delihentelv locked on the inside.

At least 6 feet (1829 mm) of clearance shall be available between the access opening and the edge of
the root or similar hazard. or rigidly fixed rails or guards a minimum of 42 inches (1 067 mm) in height
shall be provided on the exposed side. Where parapets or other huildingstruetures are utilized in lieu
of guards or rails, they shall be a minimum of42 inches (1067 mm) in height {NFPA 54:9.4.3]

l he Exterior Nlcans fAeces shall coniplv with the thllowing:
I. Side railings shall extend not less thai, 3t) inches (762 1Dm) above the iool or parapet wall.

2. 1 andings shall not exceed I S tbet (5456 mm) apart measnred from the finished grade.

3. Width slial I be not less than 14 inches (356 iun) on center.

4. Rungs spacing shall not exceed 12 inches t3{)5 mm) on center. and each rung shall be capable of
supporting a 300 Po1u1d ( 136.1 kg) load.

5. Foe space shall be not less than 6 inches (152 mm).

Exceptions:

Permanent exterior adders pr vidma roof access need no: extend closer than eight (S ) feet (2435
nm) to the finish grade.

2. A portable ladder may be used for access for a Group R Division 3 and 4 and occupancies.

3. Pemianent ladders for eqLupnlent access need not be provided at parapets or walls less than thi itv
(3(t) inches (762mm) in height.

Section 509.6.1 Tcrnii nation req uircniciits

Pagc 33 of 58



(_ (
Ac/c/cut exception toS,,bseci/on 509.6. lfl, tol’cac/ as/c/Ions:

51)9.6.1 Terni ination lZeqiiiretiienls. i-\ gas \c’IU shall terminate in accordance vi1 Ii one of the
lollowitur:

1. Gas vents that are 12 inches (300 mm) or less in size and located not less than 8 feet (2438
mm) from a vertical wall or similar obstruction shall tenmuate above the roof in accordance with
Figure 509.6.1 and Table 509.6.1,

Exception:

A single— ftnxi v residence having gas vents tw eke I 2) aches (300 mm) in st/c or smal Icr with listed
caps shall be permitted to be termitiated in accordance with Figure 509.6. 1, provided they are at
least tour (4) feet (1.2 n) from a vertical wall or similar obstruction.

lie iii. (2) i/li’o1ç4/l ( A icu/clill lci?(lIcHtgc((

Sec/lw, 603.5. 12 Beverage Dispensers

/&‘vic •c((/io;z 4l)$... /2, as follows:

603.5. 12 Beverage Dispensers. Potable water suppI to beverage ci ispensers. carbonated
erage dispensers. or coilce machines shall he protected h a listed reduced pressure principle

haelllow pre enter as approved by the authorit\ ha ing jurisdiction. I or carbonated beverage
dispensers. piping material installed dow iistrearn of the baekllow preventer shall not he affected by
carbon dio\ ide gas.

Section 603.4.2 Testing

Revise sec/iou 603.4.2. as /3/lows:

603.4.2 1 estiiita Ihe premise ow ncr or responsible person shall ha e the backliow peentio:i
assembl tested b a certihed baekflow assembly tester at the time of installation, repair, or
relocation and not less than on an annual schedule thereafter, or more olten when required b the
Authority I-lax itig Jurisdiction. the certified tester shalt Iea\e a cops of their baekllosx
certilieation on site along with a copx of Uie certification of cacti device tested. 1 lie periodic
testing shall he performed in accordance w i iN the procedures referenced iii ASS F Series 5(00 b\
a tester qualified in accordance with those standards.

Section 608.5 I )iseh a rge Piping

Revise section 608,5, adc//,jt item (8)10 m’ead as Jo/Ions:

608.5 Discharge Piping. l he discharge pipinu serving a tein perature relief alve. pressure ret ief
valve, or combination of both shall have no valves, obstructions. or means ol isolation and be
provided with the RI lowing:

Ii cuts (I) ill/u? ig/i (/)I t /7)1/fill/I IC/UI) ?gcc I

Page 34 e: 58



C
(8) For relief valves located inside a buikling. provide a drain of galvanized steel, hard— (lra\Vn
copper piping and fittings. CPVC. PP or flexible corrugated connectors complying with 604.0 or
listed relief valve drain tube with fittings that will not reduce the internal bore. of the pie or tubing
(straight lengths as opposed to coils) and shall extend from the valve to the outside of the building
or to an approved locution. Temperature and Pressure Rebel (T&P) drans shall diselarge to the
exierior of the Inn Iding unless the manufacturers listing prevents this termination. T&P drains may
discharge through an air gap into a secondary clothes washer port. or through an air gap in a floor
sink, floor mounted mop sink or a floor drain equipped with a listed funnel, provided they are
installed in accordance with section 804.1

Scctio ii 7043 Corn mei’ci a I Sin k.s
Revise section 704.3. as follows:

704.3 Coinniercia! Sinks. Pot sinks. scuflerv sinks. dishwashing sinks. stR erware sinks. eoamereial
disbwashinu machines. and other similar fixtures shall drain indirectly to the drainage svstenis by
means of an air gap.

Section 707.10 Fittings

iSc section 707. / (A to i’e nhis Jo/Ions:

707.10 Fittings. ( ICUIIOLII fittings shall be not less in size than those given in Table 707.1.

[xceptioa: \Vhere a 2-1/2” (inch) cleaaout is requned. a 2 (inch) cleanout may he used hr horizontal
branch waste lies.

Sect ion 710.1 Backllow Protection

Delcrcsccthni /10. I, (I(IdIILo’S(cti€))I 710. / to ;‘c’ad c/s Jo/Ions:

710.1 BacIl1ow Protection. [)rainage Piping serving fixtures which have flood level rims located
belots the elevation of the next upstream manhole cover of the public or pri aIe sen em serving such
drainage piping shall be protected from back flow of sewage by installing an approved type backwater
valve Other than a single dwelling unit served by an individual sewer, fixtures above such elevation
shah not discharge through the backwater valve.

Section 8013.2 Walk—in Coolers

Rcriscscct!on 801.3.2, toi’c’ados/o//oo’s:

8(11 3.2 Walk—in Coolers For walk—in coolers, floor drains shall he permitted to be connected to a
separa:e drainage line discharging into an outside receptor. The flood—level rim of the receptor shall
be not less than six inches (152 mm) lower than the lowest floor drain. Such floor drains shall be trapped
and mdi iduallv vented. (‘leanouts shall he provided at ni net> 90 degree (I .57 mad) turns and shall be
accessibly located. Such waste shall discharge through an airap into a trapped and vented receptor.
except thai ftdl—size a!rgap is requtred where the indirect waste pipe is tinder \ aeuuni

Page 35 o58



c c
Section 8013A Floor Sinks

Ac/da newsection 801.3.4 to readas follows:

8013.4 Floor Shks. Floor sinks shall be installed flush with the flnished floor and shall be accessible
for cleaning.

Section 804.1 Standpipe Receptors

Revise Section 804. I Lw adcling a new seconclpa)ag;aph, to read as follows:

Indirect waste piping other than the discharge from the clothes washer may he terminated into a
listed clothes washcr box. The second pod. on a multiport box shall be perinancitly connected to the
vertical receptor standpipe via a vye branch fitting.

Section 1009.0 Gravity Grease Interceptors

Dc/etc seetio;is 10090 tlnoitgli 1017.2, re/a/ti lab/c 1014.3.6, and add ncr: sections /009.0. tliivieg/i
1013.0 to read as/olloirs:

Gravity Grease Interccptors

General. A grease intcrceptor shall he pros ided for proper liandl ilig of liquid wastes containing
grease. A grease interceptor as described in these standards shall he installed in aiiy business
establishment with kitchen Facilities including restatirants. ca lbs. lunch count ers. cafeterias.
supermarkets, convenience stores, bakeries, bars and clubs. hotels. hospitals. sanitariums, factory
or school kitchens. or aim other commercial establishment where grease may be introduced into the
sewer system

Special consideration shall be given to every tish. tonI and animal slaughterhouse or establishment
every fish, fowl and meat packing or curing establishment; every soap factory, tallow rendering, fat
rendering and hide ctiring establishment: or an)’ other establishment fi’om which considerable amounts of
grease arc likely to he discharged into the sewer system. Written application describing exact operation
and anticipated volumes of grease shall be made to the Sanitation Authority ha ;‘in g Jurisdiction to
determine the standards for such systems.

Fixtures. The waste discharge from fixtures and equipment which may contain grease horn the
businesses set out previously shall be drained through a grease interceptor or grease interceptors.
Fbtures such as. hut not limited to. the following are included: seullerv sinks. pot and pan sinks.
dishwashing machines. soup kettles and similar cooking equipment. trash compactors. floor drains in
grease generating areas. and trash can wash areas

Prohibited fixtures. The waste lines from toilets, urinals, and other similar fixtures shall not drain
through a grease interceptor location.

I. Grease interceptors shall he so installed and connected that they shall he at all times easily
accessible for inspection, cleaning and removal of the intercepted grease.

Page 36 of 58



C
2. Grease interceptors shall be placed as close as practical to the fixtures sieved.

3. Grease interceptors shall he located on the exterior of buildings unless specifically approved
otherwise in writing by the health district.

4. Grease interceptors shall he so located as to be accessible for service without the use of ladders or
the removal of bulky equipment.

5. Location of all grease interceptors shall he shown on the approved plans.
6. Each grease interceptor shall sieve only one business establishment. iultiple business connections

to a single intcrceptor are not permitted. unless approved by the sanitation authority in writing.

7. An accessible hose bib shall he located w ithin 25 feet (7620 mm) of ever\ grease interceptor.

8. Size.

9. Grease interceptors shall be sized in accordance with Table 101 4.3.6. Interceptors shall not be more
than one size larger than i-equired inJahle 1014.3.6.

Exception: lor silliations not cm crcd by I able 1014.3.6. a submittal showing the iatcrccplor site
and calculations shall he approved b the sanitation authority prior to building ollicial plan
apiro uI. Such (leNigns shall be prepared b a Nes ada Regtstered I nuineer.

All grease interceptors shall have a minimum of two compartments with a minimum of 3 inch (76.2
mm) diameter fittings designed for grease retention. The fittings shall he installed in the following
manner: A sanitary tee shall be installed at the inlet, a sanitary tee on the inlet side of the interceptor
ha ftl e. and a sanitary tee installed at the outlet.

2. There shall be adequate access for cleaning all areas of the separator. A minimum of one access
point into each compartment within the separator shall he provided. In addition, no access points
shall he further apart than 10 feet (3048 mm) regardless of the number of compartments. Separator
covers shall be of gas.tight construction. Interceptor covers shall have a minimum opening (Ii mension
of twenty (20) inches (50$ mm) in diameter.

3 All waste shall enter the grease interceptor through the inlet pipe.

4. Grease interceptors shall he so designed that they will not become air bonnd. Each interceptor
shall he properl vented with a relief vent located on the outlet side of the interceptor.

5. Gleanouts shall be installed in the drainage piping inlet and outlet side of each grease interceptor
and the outlet side of each sample box.

6. Each fixture discharging mm a grease interceptor shall he individually trapped and
vented in an ap proved manner

7. Each grease interceptor shall have an approved water seal of not less than two (2) inches (50.8 mm)
in depth or the diameter of its outlet whichever Is greater.

Pagc 37 of 58



( (.
8. When grease interceptors are located in areas of pedestrian or vehicle travel, the design of the

interceptor shalt be adequatc to support the imposed load. Structural calculations to verify its adequacy
may be required.

9. A sample box shall be provided on the outlet side of each grease interceptor downstream oftiie
required cleanout and vent.

Water Test. A water test shall he applied to the level of the top ot the interceptor inlet opening
through the outlct opcnin or dseharge side of the sampe box. Iiierecptors shall show no leakage from
section seams. pinholes or other imperfections. Any leakage below this level is CiILISC for ejection,

Backfill. Interceptors shall not be hackfilled until the inspection has been made to verify there arc no
leaks.

Section 10 I 0 .0 Sa rid/Oil In I crcepl 1s

Saix il/Oil Jnte;’cc’pun.s.

Where Required. An interceptor shall be provided for the proper handling of liquid wastes containing oil
(otpciroleuni origin). saad, inert solids or any other similar substances.

NO’] F: A sandoil interceptor is not intended or the disposal of hazardous \\aste nr as a backup
svstcnl for accidental spills.

Interceptors i described in these standards shall he installed in. hut no limited to. the loilowing
locations: car washes, motor vehicle, boat or airplane storage yards. gasoline and diesel service stations.
repair garages or any other similar ilicility which iniiv introduce sand mid oil into the sewer system.

S ubni i ttal o t’ a written app I cation descri bing the exact facility o perat i on and the types and an tie pated
volumes ofvaste to lie generated may he required by the building otticial.

\\‘hcre provided, drains installed in enclosed parkinu garages and repair garages shall drain through an
ap 0 \ ed sand (ii I intercept or.

Fixtures. The waste discharge from fixtures and equipment which may contain sand. oil— based wastes.
and inert solids shall drain only through an interceptor. lids requirement includes, but is not limited to.
the Ijilfowing: floor drains, floor sinks, special processing eqri.pmeat.treneh drains, and area drains.

Pi’oh ihited Fixtures. The waste line from toilets, urinals, lavatories and other similar I ixt ures. which
discharge doniestie wastes only. shall not drain through the interceptor.

Location.

I. Sand/ oil interceptors shall be so installed and connected that they shall be at all times accessible for
inspection, cleaning and removal of the interceptcd waste

2. Sand I oil interceptors shall be placed as close as practical to the fixtures served
3. Sand oil interceptors shall be located on the exterior of htnldings unless specifically approved

otherwise in writing by the sanitation authority.

Page 38 0t,g



(
4. Sand: oil interceptors shall be located as to he accessible for scrvice without the use of ladders or

the removal of bulky equipment.
5. Location of all sand/oil interceptors shall be shown on the approved plans.
6. Each sandy oil interceptor shall serve only one business establishment. Multiple business

connections to a single sand oil interceptor are not permitted unless approved by the sanitation
authority n wrjtng.

Size ((lid Design.

I. All sand!oil interceptors shall be a minimum of three hundred (300) gallons (40 cubic feet) (1136
1) of total liquid capacity with a minimum floating liquid capacity of 55 gallons (208 1).

2. All sandoil imerceptors shall have a minimum of two compartments with a minimum of 3 inch
(76.2 mm) diameter fittings designed for retention. The fittings shall be installed in the following
manner: a 90° long sweep shall he installed at the interceptor inlet, a sanitary tee shall he installed
on the inlet side of the interceptor baffle. and a sanitary ice installed at the outlet.

3. There shall be adequate access for cleaning all areas of the separator. A minimum of one (I
access point into each compartment within the separator shall he provided. In addition, no access
points shall be further apart than ten (10) feet (3048 mm) regardless of number of compartments.
Access covers shall have a minimum opening dimension of twenty (20) inches (508 mm) in
diameter. Separator covers shall he of gas-tight construction.
The sand oil interceptor shall be properly vented and designed to prevent it from becoming air
bound in accordance with this code.

5. I twIt business establishment hr w liieli a sand/oil interceptor is required shall be pIo\idL’d
with an interceptor which shall serve that establishment only and no others. Scparate ow ners or
lessees within ii large Inisiiiess or establishment shall require separate interceptors.

. Iiwh sand oil inteiceplo shall have a water seal of lot less than six (6) inches (152mm).

7. When separators arc located in areas of toot or ehic1e tratlic. the design of the separator shall be
adequate thr the imposed load. Structural calculations perfbrmcd by a Nevada Registered Engineer
to yen iv adcquacy may be required.

8. Ay Iiva 0 public tash rack or slab used or cleaning machinerx or machine paiR shall drain
to a sand oil separator, and shall he adequatel protected against storm or siirthce water mtrtcson.

9. l)c’siga siandards other than those listed aho e na> be acecptahle. Redwood baffles shall not be
used or new or existing interceptors. An alternate design shall be prepared by a Nevada
Registered Engineer and submitted lbr re’s ew and approval by the ‘anitation authorit\ and the
building ollicial.

lii. Clcanoats shall be installed in the drainage ppm inlet and outlet side of each sand 0i interceptor
and the outlet side of each sample box

A sample box shall be provided on the outlet side of the interceptor dow is tream ot the required
ci canotit and vent

Vater Test. A waler test shall he applied to the level of the top of the interceptor inlet opening
through the outlet opening or discharge side of the sample box. Interceptors shall show no leakage
from section seams, pinholes or other imperfections. An leakage below this level is cause for
rejection.

Page 39 of 58



(7

Backfill. Interceptors shall not be hackfilled until the inspection has been made to verify there
are no leaks,

Section 1011.0 Maintenance of interceptors

Maintenance of Interceptors.

Grease and sand/oil interceptors shall be maintained in efficient operating condition by periodic
removal of the accumulated grease or sand1oil. No such collected grease. sand/oil, or aim material
collected from the interceptor shall be introduced into any drainage pipin. Public or private
sewers. The materials removed from interceptors shall be handled and disposed of in a proper
manner in accordance with published health district and sanitation authority requirements. Illegal
dumping ofwaste into the sewer shall not be allowed.

Maintenance records for each installed interceptor shall be maintained on the premises at all times
and presented to a duly authorized agent of the sanitation authority upon request.

The Artthorit\ Having Jurisdiction shall have the authority to mandate the installation of additional
cqui pmcnt or devices and en force a maintenance program

1012.0 Abandoned interceptors. Abandoned interceptors shall be cleaned and tilled as required
h Section 722.0 ofthe Plumbing (ode for abandoned sewers and sewage disposal facilities.

1013.0 Existing liii ildings. Whencvcr an existing building has a change in use which requires an
interceptor or whenever there is an increase in the total number of drainage fixture units served by an
existing interceptom-. one or mom-c interceptors shil I be installed in the drainage system serving the
building meeting the requirements of Sect ion 1009 and 101 0.

Section 11012 Where Required

Rc’risc section 1101.2.10 jead as Jo/Ions:

Section 1101.2 \Vhere Required. Roofs. paved areas. aids. courts, courtyards. vent shafts, light
wells, or similar areas having rainwater, shall be drained into a separate storm sewer system, or to
sonic other place of disposal catisthetorv to the Authority Having Jurisdiction. In the case ol one— and
twoianiIv du ellings. storm water shall be permitted to be (liscliarged on flat area,. such as streets
or lawns, so long as the storm water shall flow away ii’otn the building and away from adjoining
propertc and shall net create a nuisance.

Exception: I-or ton nhouses and two—Iltini K clu ellitigs. as defined in the International Residential
(‘ode. storm water may be discharged onto an adoinina propert) that is maintained [iv a eonituon
interest conlmiit[nit\ as stiptmlited in the ( ovenatits. Conditions and Restrietions ( (C& Rs) appro ed Ii
the j\uthoritv 1 lavino Jurisdiction.

Section 1101.6 Subsoil Drains

Rcrl.vc ,ccf /017 1101610 ,c-aI astu/hiia:

Page 40 otS8



C
1101.6 Subsoil Drains. Where required b\ the geoteehnical engineer or the authority having
jurisdiction, subsoil drains shall he provided around the perimeter of buildings having basements.
cellars, or crawl spaces or floors below grade. Such subsoil drains shall be permitted to be
positioned inside or outside of the footing. shall be of perforated, or open—jointed approved drain
tile or pipe not less than three (3) inches (80 mm) ifl diameter, and shall be laid in gravel, slag.crushed rock, approved three—quarter (3/4) inch (19.1 mm) crushed recycled glass aggregate. or
other approved pot’is material with not less than (4) inches (102 mm) surrounding the pipe Filter
media shall he provided for exterior subsoil piping.

Section 1101.10 Filling Stations anti Motor Vehicle Washing Establishments

Dc/crc sec/iou 1/01. 10 in its cn/iucit’.

Section 1101.11 Paved Areas

Dc/etc sect/vu 1101.111,1 its entiu’cli.

Section 1201.2 Dry Gas

Add a new sectiotu 1201.2, to i-cad as/U//oils:

1201.2 Dr Gas. Southern Nevada shall he considered a dr gas condition having a moisture and
hydrocarbon dew point below any normal temperature to which the gas piping is in an exposed
ai-ea. tmless spcciied by the local gas Inirveyor.

Section 1210.16 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings

Dc/crc section 1210.1.6 and rep/ace its cntireii, to ucad as/o1/ois:

1210.1 .6 Piping Underground Beneath Buildings. No gas piping shall be installed in or on the
ground under arty building or structure unless installed in gastight conduit, and all exposed gas
piping shall he kept at least sR (6) inches (152 mm) above grade or structure. The terut “building
or strLict ure’’ shall include structures such as porches and steps. whether covered or uncovered.
hreeiew-avs. roofed porte-coeheres. roofed patios. earports. covered walks, covered driveways, and
similar structures or appurtenances. All gas pipinu under a slab shall be capable ot’ being
ren 10 sed a 11(1 rep] aced -

ihe conduit shall be of material approved tbr installation underground beneath buildi igs and iot
less thaii Schedule 40 pipe. Ihe interior diameter ol the conduit shall be not less than one—halt’
(1/2) inch (15 mm) larger than the outside diameter ot’the gas pipin.

[he conduit shall extend to a point at least (I 2 ) inches (305 mm) be\ ond an area w here it is
required to he installed or to the outside al I ot a building, and the outer ends shall not he sealed.
\\‘hcre the conduit terminates within a building, it shall be ‘cad i lv ace essible and the space
between the conduit and the gas pipinu slial I he sealed to preeit leakage ol’ gas into the Lw i Idi ng.

Exception: Products listed fir such use.

Page 41 of 58



C C
Section Chapter 15-Alternate water sources for Non-potable Applications.

/)c/’’w Sections /50/ 1/nate 1, /505. and revise /50/ in read as /()/iOiS,

15011) Reclaimed (Recycled) Water Systems. The provisions of sections 1501.0 and I 506.0 ortliis
chapter shall not be allowed in residential buildings and shall apply to the installation.
construction, alteration. and repair of reclaimed water svstenis ntended to supply uses such as
water closets urinals. trap primers for floor drains, floor sinks, irrigation, industrial processes. water
features and other uses approved by the Authority having Jurisdiction. Potable u ater supjl i ed as
makeup water in these svsten’.s shall he protected tteainst hack—pressure and hack—siphonage in
accordance with Sections 602.0 and 603.0.

(5cc/ia,; / 502 is ietciitioiia//i left blank)
(Sect/act /503 is jiitcn,ianc,/k /c3i b/click)
(5cc//a,, 1504 is nhtcntioila/lt Ic/i bianki

Section 11801.0 Cesspools

Dc/c/c sect/oil 11801.0 in its entirely

Page 42 of 5$



(
2017 National Electrical Code

Section 21 0.70(A)( I)

Revise Ircni (I) hi Sceiio,; 2/li. 71k:?). as/v/Ions:

(I) habitable Rooms. At least one wall switch—controlled lighting oLitlet shall he inslal led in every
habitable room, kitchen. and bathroom. Unless prohibited by structural design. a wall switch shall he
located with n I .8 iii (6 ft) of the lJmtt of entry and shall not he [ocated behind an active door in the
full \ open position. Doors capable of being fixed in place arc not to be considered acli\ e doors.

Sect ion 2) 0.70( A)(2)( I)

RciRc i[ei;i (I) iii &elion 2/1). 70(Aft2), as Ia/Ions:

210.70 Lighting On ticts I{cqn wed

(A) I) tiling Units

Additional Locations. /\dditional lighting outlets shal be installed in aecorthinee with
the lb I owing.

At least one wall switch—controlled lichting outlet shall be installed in hallways. stairways.
attached garages, and detached garages with electric poer.

I laliways oJ 3.0 n (JO lfl or more in length shall have wall switches within I 4X iii (6 Ii: of
each opening or door unless prolilited h structural design.

Section 210.70(A)(2)(2)

Rct’i.ce ifeni (2) hi ,S*ihni 21’). E(fl:1H2j. as

210.7(1 Lighting Outlets Required

(A) Dwelling Units

(2) Additional Locations. Additional lihting outlets shall he installed in accordance with the
lollow log:

For dwelling tin its. attached garages, and detached garages with electric power. at least one wall
switch controlled lieliting outlet hal1 he ilbiailcd to pios ide illnminaiioa oii the exterior side of
otitdoor entrances or exits with grade level access. A ehicle door in a garage hall not he
considered as an outdoor entrance or exit. At least one wall switch thai controls an interior lighting
outlet shall be located at each keyed exterior entry. [h is switch shall he located within 1 .8 in (6
H) of the latching jamb side. unless prohibited h strttetural design. and not behind an active door
in the lltll\ open position

Bill No. 2019-13 Repeating and Replacing Chapter 15.17.010 Building Code and Amending Chapter 15.16 201 9 Clean
Page 43 of 58



C C
Article 225.32 Location

Anic’ncl Article 225.32 to read as/allows:

225.32 Location. The disconnection shall be installed or attached to the outside of the building or
structure served or where the conductors pass through the building or structure. The disconnecting means
shall be at a readily accessible location nearest the point of entrance of the conductors. For the
of this scction. the requirements in 230.6 shall be permitted to be utilized.

Exception No. 1: For installations under single management. where documented safe switching
procedures are established and maintained for disconnection and where the installation is monitored by
qualified individuals, the disconnected means shall be permitted to be located elsewhere on the premises

Exception No. 2: For buildings or other structures qualified under the provisions of Article 685, the
disconnecting means shall be permitted to be localed elsewhere on the prel1ises.

Exception No. 3: For towers or poles used as lighting standards, the disconnecting means shall be
pcnnittecl to be located elsewhere on the premises.

Exception No. 4: For poles or similar structure used onl v for support of signs installed in accordance
with Article 600, the disconnecting means shall be pennitted to be located elsewhere on the premises.

Exception No. 5: The disconnecting means may be located independent of the building or structure
served, in direct line of sight. hut not to exceed thirty feet (30’).

Exception No. 6: The service disconnecting means may be installed within a building when an external
remote shunt tr:p svitcl is provided. All shunt trip switches shall be located at seven feet (7’) above
finish grade at a location approved by the fire department. All shunt trip switches shall be heated within
a twelve inch (12”) equilateral triangle, red in color.

Article 230.71J(. )(I) Readily Accessible Location

A,nc,id A it/c/c 230. 70(A}(l) to read as/h/Ions:

230.70(A)(1) Readily Acccssible Location. The service disconnection means shall he installed outside
of a building or other structure at a readily accessible location nearest the point of entrance of the service
conductors. The disconnecting means may he located independent of the building or structure served, in
direct line of sight. but not to exceed thirty feet (30’). at a readily accessible location either outside of a
building or structure or inside nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors.

Exception: The service disconnectinu means may he installed \vithin a hi.nlding when an external remote
shunt trip switch is provided. All shunt trip switches shall he located at seven feet (7) above finish grade
at a location approved by the fire department. All shunt trip switches shall he located within a twelve
inch (1 2’’) equilateral triangle, red in color.

Bill No. 2019-13 Repeating arid Replacing Chapter 15.17.010 Building code and Amending Chapter I 5.16 201 9 Clean
Page 44 ofS8



C
250.52 Grounding Electrode System.

(A) Electrodes Permitted for G rounding

(I - -/ i’eiflUiii

(4) Rod Electrodes. Rod e]ectrodes shall not be less than 2.44 m (8 ft) in length and shall consist of
stainless steel and copper or zinc coated steel and shall he at least 15.875 mm (5/8 in.) in
diameter, unless listed.
Remainder of’ section unchanged

Section 250.53

Rev/sc Section 250. 53l), asfollona:

250.52 (;rotindiiig Electrode System Installation.

(A) Rod Electrodes. Rod electrodes shall meet the reqLiirements of 250.53 (A )( I ) through (A )( 3).

Below Permanent Moisture Level. If practicable. rod ciccirodes shall he embcddcd below
pcminriwnt illOistLii’c leVel. Rod electrodes shall be lee horn iloncoilductixe eoatinu such as paint
or enamel.

(I) Supplemental Electrode Required. A single rod electrode shall be sLipplenlcnted liv an
additional electrode ot a type specifed in 250.52L\)(2) through ()O(7), I he supplemental electrode
shall pemniitted to be bonded to nile of the ftlllo\ving:

(I) Rod electrode
(2) Grounding elect rode conductor
(3 ) Grounded service—entrance conductor
(4) Non flexible grormclcd ser cc racc’.va\

5 ) An’ grounded service enclosure

Exception: ifa single rod grounding electrode has a resistance to earth of’ 25 ohms or less, the
supplemental electrode shall not he required.

(2) Supplemental Electrode. If nialriple rod electrodes are installed to nicet the reqairements of
this section. they shaH not be less than I .8 in (6 ft ) apart

lnftlrmational Notes: The paralleling efficiency of rods is increased by spacing them twice the
I enath of tile longest rod.

Section 250.53(8)

Rev[cc •Scciion 25053(5). as/b/Ions:

250.53 (irounding I. lectrode System Installation

Bill Sn, 2019-13 Repealing and Replacing chapter 5.17.010 Building Code and Amending Chapier 15.16 2019 Clew
Page 45 ofSS



(
(B) Electrode Spacing. Where more than one of the electrodes of the type specified in
250.52(A)(5) are used, each electrode of one grounding system (ineludinu that used for strike
termjnation (1ev ices) shall not he less than I 83 iii 6 11) trom any other electrode of another
grounding system. Two or more groundtng electrodes that are bonded together shafl be considered
a single grounding electrode system.

Section 250.53(0)(2)

Revive Ii em 2i iii .cec,/on 250.53 ((h (2). uxThI/uir.s:

(2) .Stipplcniental Electrode Req ii irecl, A metal underground water pipe shall he supplemented hv
an additional electrode of a type specified in 25O.52(A )(2) throLigh (A)(? ) . If the supplemental
electrode is of’ the rod type. it shall comply with 250.53(A). The supplemental cleetiode shall he
bonded to one or the flil lowing:

(I) Grounding electrode cond Lictor
(2) Grounded service—entrance conductor
(3) Nonflex ihle grounded service raceway
(4) Any grounded service enclosure

(5) As provided h 250.3205) Reiuamdcr unchanged

Section 250.53(F)

)?Li!’c’ .Si’e//tni 51)S5iTi as/u)/nu.:

250.53 Grounding Electrode System Installation.

(F) Supp!cmental Electrode Sondiiig Connection Size. Where the supplemental electrode is a rod
ci ectiode. that purton of the bondingi aniper hint is the sole connect ion to t lie sappi einenl a I ground i
electrode shall not be recluireC to he larger than 6 AWG copper wire or 4 A\VG aluminum wile.

Section 250.53(C)

Rrvit .Seeflna 250.5$((), o.s/ollv.i*s:

250.53 C ron rid I rig F lee I rode System Irista lliition.

(C) Rod Electrodes. The electrode shall be installed such that at east 2.44 lfl (8 Ii) of length is in
contact with the soil. It shall he driven to a depth ol’not less than 2.44 iii (8 I except that. where
rock bottom is encnuntereo. the electrode shall he driven at an oblique angle not to exceed 45
degrees Ironi the vertical or. where rock hottoiu is encountered at an angle up to 45 degrees, the
elect rode shall he periiiittcd to he buried In a trench that is at least 750 miii (30 hi.) deep. Elie upper
end of the electrode shall he flush vitli or below ground level unless the ahoveground end and the
grounding electrode conductor attachment are protected against physical damage as spec i fled in 250

1 0.

Bill No. 2019-15 Repea]ing and Replacing Chapter 15.17.010 Building Quite and Amending Chapter 15.16 2019 Clean
Page 46 of 58



C
Section 250.53(11)

Dc/crc Section 25(1.53(1-1), ii? Its nhliI’ei1 as lotions:

250.53 Grounding Electrode System Installation.

Section 250.1 20(0)

‘Ida a ncit Subsection (DJ to Secuoo 251. / 20, ret is’ a. /o/ions:

250.120 Equipment Grounding Conductor Installation.

(I)) Eq uipnicnt Groutiding Conductor. All raccwavs installed on roofs shall contain
an equipment grounding conductor sued per Fable 25(3.122 installed with the circuit conductors.

/.VCCpl II Nü. 1: Lou u’oitage, C01)lIflOhIiCa lion ((11(1 sHin/ar 1IJ)C SI5/c1)lS unless Icr/ui/ed
elscuuiic’i’c Iii tin’ (u(/c.
Lvce1’tioi; zVo. 2: Is pei’nincd /u -fri/c/c 2511.86 .101 short .5a’duniS @1 meiul cnciOsll!’’s 01’
‘uceu I rn 5

2015 International Property Maintenance Code

j’hLc code is hereby aniended us/h//otis:

By replacing all references to “international Mechanical Code’’, “International Plumbing Code”,
‘[CC Electrical Code’’ with ‘‘Uniform Mechanical Code’’. Uniform Plumbing Code’’, and National
Electric Codc’ respcctively where ever they occur.

By deleting all references to the lntcrnational Zoning Code

Section 101.1

lit/c is enended asfo//oiu’s:

By inserting the [Name of Jurisdiction] as “Pahrump Regional Planning District”

Section 102.3

By deleting the existing paragraph and inserting the following:

“repairs, additions or alterations to a structure, or changes of occupancy. shall he done in accordance
with the procedures and provisions of the current adopted editions of the International Building
Code. International Residential Code, Unufon’n Mechanical Code. Uniform Plumbing Code.
International Fire Code, International Energy Conservation Code, International Property
Maintenance Code, and the National Electric Code”

Bill No. 2019-13 Repealing and Replacing Chapter 15.1 7.010 BC]ilding CoiL’ and Amending Chapter 15.16 201 9_Clean
Pagc 47 ofSS



C C
*

Section 103.1

General is aniendecl as /3//on’s:

By deleting the existing paragraph and inserting the following:

“Code Compliance Division of Nyc county Planning is the duly recognized Enforcement
authority’

Section 103.5

Br 1e/eting the existitig pantg;’apl: and inserting the follotri;zg:

“The fees for activities and services performed by the department in canTing out its responsibilities
under this code shall be indeated and adopied by a separate resolution.”

Section 112.4

By inserting the [AMOUNT dollars or more than FAMOUNTJ dollars. As S500 and SI 000
respectively.

Section 302.4

By inserting the [JURISDICTION TO INSERT II lEIGH] IN INCHES]. AS 12’ (INCHES).

Section 304.14

B deleting the existing paragraph and subsections in its entiretN

Section 602.3

Replace the words “during the period from [DATE] to [DATE] to read: “rear—round”

Section 602.4

Replace the words “during the period from [DATE] to [DATE] to read: “year-round”
2018 International Swimming Pool & Spa Code

Section Chapter 1

Dc/crc Chaprer liii its entirety except. Section 101. Revise Sections 101.1 and 101.2

101.1 Title. These regulations shalt be known as the International S\\ imming Pool and Spa
Code. hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

Bill No. 2019-13 Repealing and Replacing Chaprer 15.17,010 Building Code and Amending Chapter 15.16 2019_Clean
Page 48 of 58



C
101.1 Scope. The provisions of this code apply to the construction, alteration, movement.
renovation. replacement repair and maintenance or rise of aquatic recreation facilities, pools
and spas. The pools and spas covered bx’ this code are either permanent or temporary. and
shalt he only those that are designed and manufactured to be connected to a circulation
system anu that are intenUed for swimming. bathing or wading. Where this code refers to
codes not adopted by the jurisdiction, the applicable code adopted h; the Jurisdiction shall
govern.

Section Chapter 2 definitions

Add a 126W dc’finiuoii to CilUjitcI’ 2

MANMADE DECORATIVE WATER FEATURE: Any manmade stream. fountain.
waterfall. or other water feature that does not meet the definition ofa pool or spa and
contains circulating water that flows or that is sprayed into the air. constructed for decorative.
scenic or landscape mirposes. An manmade decorative water features greater than 1$ inches
(457 mm) of maximum water level or installed overflow water depth shall med the
requirements ofa swimming pool as specified in Chapters 2 through 10.

Exceptions: The following bodies of water shall be exempt from these requirements:

A. Manmade lakes as dehned in local ordinance or arlmillistt’ati\ e code.

13. Pools and spas regulated In this doctuneut or adniitnstrativc code.

C. \Vater feature not greater than IS inches (457 mum) i’ inuxilnrmn waler le el or installed
overflow waler le ci. used in conjunction with and on the same property as a single—family
residence, and available only to the liuniiv o[the householder or their pri\ ate guests.

MANUFACTURED POOL. OR SPA. A listed 1)001. spa or water feature that is manufactured or
constructed at another location, transported to the propeity, and placed and/or assembled at the
property.

.e’iioi; 304

1 )c/ctc Sect/au 304 in its cuu!iuY’il’,

Section 305 Barriers

Rcrisc entlie sect/out 305. 1 hrI( 305.2. 10

305. 1 Ccii eral.i he pi’o isions o fth is sect ion shall alml\ to the design of harriers for restricting
entry into areas ha\ ing flOOiS and spas. \\‘licre spas or hot tubs are equipped with a lockable
safety cover comnpl ing with ASTM F I 346 the areas w here those spts or hot tubs. are
located shall not he required to comp lv with sect ion 305 .2 through 305, 1 4.

Bill No. 20] 9—13 Repealing and Replacing Chapier 5. I 7.010 Bnildnig Code and Amending Chapter 15, 6 201 9 Clean
Page 49 of 58



(.
305.2 Swimming pools anti spas. Outdoor pools and spas and indoor swimming pools and

spas shall be surrounded by a barrier that complies with Sections 305.2 1 through 305. 1 4.

Exception: Water leatures w ith a maxim urn water depth ol 1 8’’ or less.

305.2. I Barrier height and clearances. The top of residential barrier including gates and
doors shall not he less than 60 inches (I 524 mm) in height above adacent grade measured
from outside the cue losure. or a vertical 8 feet ç2 .4 in) non—cl i inhable harrier. measured on
the inside. The maximum vertical clearance between grade and the bottom of the barrier shall
he 4 iitehes (I 01 .6 inni ). When permanently nstal led pools or spas are in adjacent yards the
conimon hairier ina\ be reduced to 48 Inc lies (12 I 9.2 inn) on either side.

ihe Ptihlic barriers including gates and doors shall not lie less than 72 inches in height above
adjacent grade mcastired from otitside the enclosure. The maximuni vertical clearance
bet\\ ccii grade and the bottom ol the harrier shall he 4 Inches (101.0 mm),

305.2.1 Wrought Iron. Vertical rough iron Jence. open etiardriils shall lia\ e pickets sPLtced
such that a sphere 4 inches (101.6 miii) in diameter cannot pass through. I lorizontal support
members shall be spaced at least 32 inches (813 nun) apart and shall comply with Section
305.2.1.

305.2.2.1 Wnnmght Iron with Masonry. Residential barriers tisina mixed use ol masonry
and wrought iron walls shall coniplv with all ol the following:

i\lasonr or wrotight iron portion ofthe wall shall lie a niininiuni o132 inches ($13 nun) in
height.

2. lie w rotmehi iron portion of the wall shall coniplv with Sections 305.21 with a niaxiniuin ol
two horizontal members. one near the hottcmn. witlun 4 inches (I 01.6 mni) ol the Illasonrv
all helow. mid one a niinimntim of 60 inches (1524 miii) ahoe grade.

305.2.3 Solid barrier slirfimees. SOIKI barriers that do not ll:tve openings shall not contain
iidentions or protrusions that form handhold5 and Iiiot holds, except br nornial construction
tolerances mid tooled masonr\ joints.

305.2.3 Chain link (limensions. 1 lie maximum opening formed b a chain link fence shall be
not more than I ‘o inches (44nini). Where the fence is pros ided with slats fastened at the 101)
and bottom w hich reduces the openi such openings shall be not greater than I Inches.
1 he fence shall ha e top and bolt oni horizontal supports. 1 lie fence height nitist be a
niininitnn oh 00 inches (1524 miii) tmd shall he constrtmcted of not less than 11—gauge wire.

305.2.3 Diagonal members. XV Ii c r e the harrier is coin posed o f diagonal members, the
maximum opening lormcd b the diagonal members shall be no more than I

inches (44 mm). lEe angle of diagonal members shall not be greater than 45 degrees (0.79 rad
Ironi vert cal -

Bitt No. 2019-13 Repeating and Replacing Cliamiter 15. I 7.010 Building Code and Amending Chapmcr 15. 6 20! 9 Clean
Page 50 of 58



(
305.3 Gates. Access gates shall comply with the requirements of Section 305.3.! through 305.6

305.3. 1 Gales or Doors. All single gates or door> a ma mum ot 8 6et (2.4 in ) or less iii w rdth.shall meet the following requirements

I. Gates and doors shall he self—closing and self—latching and comply with 305.3.2.
2, Gates shall open outward from the enclosed pool area.

305.3.1 Latch Cs. The self—latching de\ ices of gates or doors shall be one ol the lo] lowing

lie release meehamsmn of’ the sd f-latehi ng de\ ice sha [I be located on the pool or spa side o I’
the gate not less than 3 inches (78mm) or more than 6 inches from the top ol’tlie gate or door.
The gate. door and harrier shall not have openings greater than % inch (12.7mm) within 18
inches (457) of the release mechanism

2. Key—operated, self—latching locks maybe be mnotmiited at am height abo e grade. Key—operated.
self—latching locks that are integral to the gate or door ma\ be used as latching devices, as long
as they are llem’n1amleltl> locked from the outside.

3 Adevtce that is an AS’I .M F—I 008. approved latching device. The latch shall be instal lcd per
the inanutitcttim’er’s installation instructions.

305.3.1 No other dcx icc shall impede operation or obstruct closing of gate or door and the self—
Latching device,

305.3 I arge Access Harriet’ Gates. Single access barrier gates greater than $ feet (2.4 in) inwidth shall be self-closing and self’iatelnng. Protected b a bam’rier have openings not greaterthan % inch (I 2.7mm) within 1$ inches (457 nm ) ol the release mechanism, or lockablehardware and shall remain locked at all times when not in usc.

Exception: Electronic remote latches w ithoimt manual dcx ices and pale hardware where
requ’ed shall not be subject to height restrictions.

305.3 l)ouhle or multiple—Gates. Double gates or multiple gates shall have not txxcr than one
leaf secured in phmee and the adacent Ical’ shall be secured xx ith a self-closing, sell—latching
dcx ice. The gate and barrier shall not have openings larger than % inch (12.7 mill) within 18
inches (457 win) oh tIle latch release mechanism. 1 he self—latching dcx ice shall coIllpiv xx ith
the requirements of Section 305.3.2.

Exceptions: A I leal of the gate shall remai ii locked when not in use. If double gates are used
as the oak access to the \ ard. one gate shall be pinned and locked in the closed position and
the adi oi ning gate in list meet the requ iremnctmts of Section 305.3. I . 305.3.2.

305.3 Electric Operated Gates. Electric operated gates shall start to close within 30 seconds of
cut iv.

305.3 Secondary Access Barrier RcqLmiremcnt.

Bitt Nn. 20 t 9. 3 Repeating iint Replacing Chapmci t 5. t 7.010 Bnitdmg Code and Amending Chapter ) 5. t6 201 9Ctean
Page 51 ol 58



(
Where a valI of the dwelling or structure serves as part of the barrier and where doors or

\\ indows provide direct access to the pool or spa through that w all an additional harrier that
isolates all openings iii the dwelling unit from the residential pool or spa shall he erected. One
of the lol lowing options shall he required:

305.3.1 Option one. Mesh lene ng. other than chain link fences shall he installed in accordance
with the InailLtfacturers instructions and shall compl\ with the following:

I. the top of the harrier shall he not less than 48 inches (1219 miii) above grade measured on the
side ofihe harrier that Ihees awaY from the pool or spa.

2. I he bottom of the mesh fence shall be not more ihan 1 inch (25 nun) nbo\ e the (leek or installed
surlace or grade.

3. I he ertical clearance between grade and the bottom of the barrier shall not exceed 2 inches
(51 nini) for grade surfaces that are not solid, such as grass or grax ci. where measured on the
side of the barrier that faces aw ay from the pool or spa.

4. The fence shall he designed and constructed so that it does not allow passage of a 4—inch sphere
tinder or th to ugh an mesh pane)

5. The liaxitnum vertical clearance from the bottom ol the mesh hence and the solid surhce shall
not permit the fence to be Ii lied more than 4 inches (1 02 nun) from grade or decking.

6. An attachment device shall attach each barrier section at a height not lower than 45 inches
(1 143 mm) above grade. Common attachment devices include, bitt are not limited to. devices
that provide the secttrit equal to or greater than that ofa hook-amid-eve-type latch mcorporaimg
a spring—actuated retaining Ic’. er such as a safèt gate hook.

7. All gates shall he self-closing and latching al the top oftlie barrier. No other dcx ice shall impede
operation or obstruct the closing of self-latching gate. \\heme a hinged gate is used’.’. jilt a mesh
harrier, the gate shall comply xx ith Section 305.3.

8. Patio deck sleex es such as sem’t iea I receptacles w hich ate placed inside the p io surhace
shall be of a noneondtictix c material.

305.3.2 01)11011 two. Self—closing and self—latching dcx ices installed on all openings in (Iwelling
unit that prox ide direct access to the pool or spa. Openings to include doors: operable
xx indows with a sill height of48 inches ( 1219 nun) or less: and pet doors allowing the
passage ola sphere ol4 inches (I 02mm) iii diameter.

Exception:
. perahIe windows with a sill height less than 4$ inches t 1219 miii) xx ith a inantifacttmrer

installed permanent locking or latching mechanism mounted not less than 54 inches (I 372mm)
from Iloor,

ID. Seli—closina. self—latching pet doors appros ed b the building official.

3(15.3.2 Option thi’ee. An alarm shall he installed on all openinus in dwelling unit that proxide
direct access to the pool or spa. Openings to ineltide doors: operahle windows w ithi a slit
height of 48 inches or less’, and pet doors a I low ing the passage ol a sphere of 4 inches (I 02
mm) in diameter. The alarm shall be listed and labeled as a water hazard entrance alarm in

Bitt No. 2019—13 Repeating and Replacing Chapter 517(00 Buikting Code and Amending Chapier 15.16 2019 Clean
Page 52 ofSS



C
accordance with U L 20 1 7.

Ihe alarm shall sound contInuOusly br a m inirnum ci’ 31) seconds within 7 seconds after the
door is opened and be a minimum of capable of pro iding 85 dB when measured indoors at
I () led (3.05 iii). the alarm shall automatically reset under all conditions. The alarm shall be
equipped \ itli a rnaniia I means, such as a touch Thid 01’ switch, to temporari lv deaet i ate the
alarm ir a single openi nu. 1 he deaet i ation sw itch shall he acated at least 54 inches (1372
mm) a hove the th resho Id oft he door.

Exception:
()jierahle w indos with a sill height less than 48 inches (ID I 9mm) with a manufacturer
installed permanent locking or latching mechanism mounted not less than 54’’ from floor.

2. Self—closing, self—latching pet doors appro\ed b the bulding ollicial. In dwellings or
structures not required to he Accessible tinils. Type A units or lvpe 13 units. the
deactivation sw itch shall he located 54 inches ( 1372 nun) or more abo e the finished floor.
Indwcilmgs or structures required to he Accessible units. -l >p i\ units or Type B units, the
operable raN olthe alarm deactivation switches shall be located not greater than 54 inches
(1372 mm) and not less than 48 inches (1219 ruin) above the liiiished Iloor.

305.3.2 Option Iotir. A pool notion device. laser or lEghi beam activation alarm s\ stem
perrnaiient[ installed that pro ides an acti e barrier \\ ititin the pool or across the access to the
pool li’oni the dwelling unit or installed around the entire pen neter of the pool. [he device shall
sound an alarm ofat least 85 (I El both inside and outside olthe home when activated. Ihe alarm
must automnaticall reset after alarming. Flie device and alariii shall meet ASTM [2208 and be
listed.

3t15.3.2 Option five . :\s’titCtv cover tha is listed 1111(1 labeled in accordance w ith AS! NI F 1 346 is
installed fir the pools and spas.

305.7.6 Option six. An approved alternate means ot protection. such as seT I—closing doors with self—
latch m rig devices. pro”ided that the degree of protection aftbrded is riot less than the protection
afihrded by sections 3057. I through 305.7.5 and appmo\edi by the authority havingiurisdietroa.

305.8 On ground resideri hal pool strimetitre as a harrier. An on groand residential pool wall
strtretttre or a barrier mounted on top of an on ground resideiitia pool wall structure shall serve as a
harrier where all oft lie following conditions are present:

I. \Vhere oak the pooi wall serves as the harrier, the bottom of the wall is on grade, the lop of the
val I is not less than 48 inches (12 1 9 nm) above grade for the entire p e:imeter of the poo1.
the xal I complies with the requirements of Section
305.2 305 .7 arid the pool rnanufbcturer allow s the wall to serve as a barrier.

2. \\. here the barrier is mounted on top ot the pool \val I. the top o fthe barrier is not less than 48 inches
(1219 mm) above grade for the entire perimeter of the pool. and the requirements of Section

305.7.

Bit No. 201’)— t 3 Repeal agand Repacing Ciiaver 15. I 7.010 Bulidaig Code and Amending Chapier 15. 16 2019 Clean
Page 53 nf58



C. (.

3. Ladders or steps used as means of access to the pool al-c capable of being secured. locked
or removed to prevent access e\eept where the ladder or steps arc surrounded by a harrier that
meets the requirements of Section 305.2--505. 7.

4. Openings eieated by the securing, locking or removal of ladders and steps do not allow the passage
cia 4 inch (1(32 mm) diameter sphere.

5. Baniers that are mounted on top of on ground residential poo1 ‘a als are installed in accordance
with the pool manufacturer’s instructions.

305.9 N atural barners. In the case where the pool or spa area abuts the edge ot a lake or other
natural both of water, nublic access is not permitted or allowed along the shoreline, and required
barriers extend to and beyond the water’s edge a mini irium of I S inches (457 mm). a barrier is not
required between the natural body of water shore I inc and the pool or spa.

305.9 Natural topogi-aph . Natural topography that prevents chreet access to the pool or spa area
shall include but not be limited to mountains and natural rock fhrmations. A natural barrier appro ed
by the governing body shall he acceptable provided that the degi-ee of protection is not less than the
protection afforded by the requirements of Sections 305.2 through 305.7.

305.11 Barrier Timeliness. All required access barrier elements shall lie installed prior to:

- Installation ota pre—inaitihiettirecl pool or spa.
2. The pvc-plaster i nspectic m of a conventional lv constructed pool or spa.
3. ‘I he tilling otan water feature.

305.12 Surv cii lance Substittite. In I cu of access barriers required by this code. therapeutic
facilities used by or 1111(1ev the direct control of licensed medical pclsoi1cl. and resort hotel
lacilities ma provide a dedicated guards that onservation is maintained at all times. An alternate
method nay be submitted n writing aid approved by the Building Official. Such submittal shall
beeo nc a peru i aneW art of - th ej oh reco i’d.

305.13 Responsible Party. the owners of the propcrl\ upon which poo1s. sIms or an i ic ial bodies
of water are located are responsi hI e to establish and maintain access harriers. The owner or developer
of land adjacent to an access hairier required hvthis section shall not reduce, degrade, or infringe on
the access barrier’s compliance w it h this code.

305.14 Alternate Materials or Methods: An application for alternate materials or methods must
be reviewed a id approved by the Building 0 Iticial für any popcised access barrier ‘a hieh does not
meet the requirements of i Ii is code, If approved by the t3ti Iding Oflieial. the owner remains
responsible for establishing and maintaining so cli approved alternate materials or ni ethod s

Section 307.1.1

Revive .c’Iiun 307,1. /

Bill No. 2019-13 Repealing and Replacing Chapler 15.17.010 Building Code alit’ Ameiicimg ClIapler 15.16 2tJ 19 Clean
Page 54 of 58



(

307.1.1 Glazing in hazardous locations. Hazardous locations for glazing shall he as defined in
the lnternation&d Building Code or the International Residential Code. \\‘here glazing is
deterini ned to be in a hazardous location, the requirements for glazing shall be in accordance with
those codes. as applicable. Cilazing in walls or barriers within 60 inches (1 524 mm) or less, of the
‘a ater’s edge and less than 60 i aches ( i 524 mm) vertically above a stanchng or \\ alhing surface
shall be considered hiizardci LI5 locations.

Section 307.2.2

Rev/ye Sec’ikni 31)7.2. 2 ax

3072.2. Materials and structn ml design. Pools and spas shall confonn to one or mole of the
standards indicated in table 307.2.2. The structural design of pools and spas shall be in accordance
with the International Building Code. II pernutted hv the Building Oftical. a geotechnieal
in \cstigation report is not required for structural designs vlii ch utilize a minim urn lateral bearing
pressure of 60 pst’ ft and an Exposure (‘lass 52 (severe sulfate exposure level). l’he structural design
nay only titilize less stringent geotechnical parameters Vt hen a gcoteehnical investigation report is

proside that fully eompiies with the requirements of the 201$ IBC Chapter I S. The structural
design shall account for the effects of any surcharge loading that is present. lateral earth pressure
due to seismic motion need not he included in the design.

307.2.2.1 Gnti,mt) w aler Protection. II groundwater is present. a hydrostatic \ alve shall he
installed at the lowest point: or other approved means shall he provided to prevent buoyant uplift.

Section 3112.4

a item r .S’,,/iee.’ctiaj, 3/1.1.4.

3112.4 Adequate L)rainage. Equipment shall he installed with adequate ciratnrgc. Equipment in
aults or pits shall have an approved means to drain water from the \aLtlt or pit.

Section 313.4

1?emi.vc’ Sec/loll 3 /3.4 1(1 (Ic/Cl sit!Jxc’e/ioIl 3 /3.4. 1:

3 13.4 I .ocation. I’uinps and motors shall he aecessi lie for inspection and service in accordance
with die manufaci ta’ers specifications.

313.4.1 Equipment ..‘\nv outdoor equipment pad shall not be in contact with any foundation.
Equipment shall he installed with adequate draiage. Equipment in vaults or pits shaH ha\ e an
appi’o ed means to drain water from the pit. Eq iapment shall he installed in accordance with the
currently adopted Codes. listing requirements and the manutheturer’s installation instructions.

Section 320.1

II \o. 21)9-13 Repezing anu Repacing C:jicu 15. 7.0 to BuiIcic Code and Amending Cbaper 15. 6 201 9Clern
Page 55 of 58



/?i’x/e seclioti 320. ito icad as/n//ons:

324). I Backwash water or (Iraining water. Bae/ciiwcli iiaiei and (Iranhing itT/el s/ia/I be
dischaiged to 1/ic’ snot/air scii’e, 01 i,ilo LIII ap/Iloled disposal S is/eu: vi: I/ic premise.
or shall be disposed of bx Otiler means ap1n’o ted by tle state or local authorit Direct connect ions
shall not be made between the end of the backwash line and the djsposal s’eatem. Drains shall
discharge Ill rough an air gap.

Section 323.lthrn 323.13

Ret/se 325. 1 i/nit 323. 1.3 to ,nnl asfol/oii’.s:

323.1 Hand holds required. Where the depth below tile design waterline of the pool or spa
exceeds 42 inches (1067 mill). handholds along the perimeter shaH be provided. Handholds shall
he located at the top of deck or coping. or as inodi bed Ill SeetiOil.

323.1.2 Handhold shall hc a mnilltIin ofó indIes (152.4 mm) long and I \2 inches decp.
Exceptions:

1-landlmolds shall not he required wherc an underwater beilell. seat or swin out is installed.
2. Handholds shall not he required br va\e action pools and action ri ci’s.

323. I .1 Height above water. Handholds slia I be located ot more thaa 2 inchcs (305 mill)
aho\ e the clc’.st,i lm-atei/o:c’.

323.1.2 llaiullmold tpe. HaildilOlds shall he one or more of the following:

Top ot’deck or coping
2. Rail
3. Rock. or artificial rocks with design halldliolds in rock.
4. Designed Ledge. nliniinum 3 inches deep. not mote tItan 12 inches ( 31)Sinni) above the design

\vaterl inc or 6 inches below.
5 Ladder
S Stair step
7. Any design tllat allows holdingon witll one Iland while at the side otthe

8. lndividtmal tile handllolds. Aliachnleni mast he nw.de by an appro\ cci listed waterprool cr.o\.
S Vanishing edge sloping into tile main hock’ ot’ater shall lla\e a nntxinlc[nl x’all thickness of

15 inches (3S I 111111) sheu used as a liamidllold.

323.1.3 Handhold spacing. Handliolds shtdl be llorizomltallv spaced not greater than 4 feet (1219
ill l1 ) apart.

Section 323.4

Add Item’ Sect/on 323.4

Bill No, 2019-13 Repealing and Replacing Chapter 15.1 7.010 Building Code and Amending Chapier 15.16 2019 Clean
Page 56 of 58



(
323.4 Wind Sensors.

\Vater features and fountains on commercial properties shall be equipped with an integral automatic wind
sensor device calibrated to shut off airborne and iuoviiwz water when wind velociR exceeds twenty
in i les per hour.

Section 323.5

/1 k (a ize r Sect lvii 3215

323.5 Water features. N laimiaue decorative water features and or vanishing edge catch basins greater
than 24 inches (6) 0 mm) in depth with walls that are inclined greater than lorty— 0 ye (45°) degrees. shall
have a means of entry1egress complying with sections 411 or 809.

Section 324

A cli nnr .sucIiuii cli?ci sub i’oiqs 324. 324.!, 324.2, 324.3, 314.4

SECTION 324- SITE WORK, SETI3ACKS AND CLEARANCE REQUIREMENTS

324.1 Site Work. Excavation areas shall be protected so that they do not endanger life or property.
1cm pai’arv barricades shall he maintained in pl aceaid kept in good order ttiit il perm aneiit anner s ate
installed. It shall he the responsibility of the contractor or owner to verify property line locations prior to
e \ ca at 0 Ii.

324.1 Pool or Spa I..ocation. :\ny pool or spa shall not be placer! closer than 6() inches (1524 mm)
to any window (o a btiikling or structure and shall ot encroach within public utility easements,

Exception: An exception may lie permitted when substantiation is provided by a Nevada Licensed
Structural or Civil Engineer that no damage will occur to buildings .structures or adJacent properties and
that no unsat structural conditions will exist.

324.1 I)i’aiitagc. Site Drainage shall lie provided to direct ali di’aiiage from site. pcrnneter decks, and
i’ools away li’oiii the pool or spa and adjacent buildings and structures. Overall site drainage shall be
niaintaincd,

324.1 Overhead Conductor Clearances. Overhead condactors shall meet the clearance requirements in
this section. Where a mini iium clearance from the s ater level is gi en. the measLireluent shall lie taken
from the maximum water level ot’thc specified hod of water.

324.1.1 Power. \Vith respect to ser\ ice diop codtic’ors ana open overhead service conductors. and open
o’. erhead \virinu. swimmIng pool and similar Installations shall comply with ininimu:n clearances given
In \ a’ Table 680,9(A) and i lustrateu in N [C’ Figure 680.91 A).

324.1.1 Communications Systems. Communication, radio, and television coaxial cables within the
scope of .—\rtic!es 800 through 820 of the NEC’ shall he permitted at a height of not less than 3.0 in (10 fi)

Biii No. 2019- 13 Repealing arid Repiaeing Chapter 15.1 7.010 Buiiding Code and Amending Chapter i 5.16 20 i 9Ciean
Page 57 o158



I

above s\vimlniflg and \\ uding pools. diving structures, and observation stands, towers. ot platforms.

2018 International Fire Code

Bill No. 201 13 Repealing and Replacir:g Cliap:er IS. I 7.010 Build:rg Codc and Aner.ding Ci;ac 5.16 20 9Cle:
Page 58 nf 58


